FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request the following information from the council's housing department.

 

Please could I find out: 
1. How much of the money allocated to the council through the Homelessness Prevention Grant in 2021/22 has been spent as of March 1 2022? Please break down in table format how much of the funding was: A) From the £310million grant and B) From the £65m additional funding grant?
· Leicester received £948,658 from the £310 million grant, and an additional £198,912 from the 65 million top-up grant.

· Leicester are forecasting and on track to spend the whole amount.

2. What has the money allocated to the council through the Homelessness Prevention Grant in 2021/22 been spent on? Please break down in table format 
The Grant received is one part of the greater funding picture for the services provided.  We are not currently able to offer an answer to this question, and will be unable to do so until after the financial year-end reconciliation and allocations are complete.  Therefore, at present, the Council does not hold this information.  This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council. 

3. How much of the Homelessness Prevention Grant allocated to the council in 2021/22 has been used to help:  a) Households in rent arrears?  b) Households at risk of eviction for other reasons?
a) £198,912

b) This is not possible to provide as we do not record time and cost with regard to individual cases, and therefore cannot establish the proportion of staffing costs for these case types.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council. 

4. How many households has the council helped through the Homelessness Prevention Grant in 2021/22?
This is not possible to provide accurately as we do not record time and cost against specific funding sources.  Furthermore, Quarter 4 figures are not yet available.  We would suggest you place a subsequent request 2 months following close of Quarter 4.  We would then be able to confirm how many households presented to the Council as homeless or threatened with homelessness in 2021/22.  We might then be able to estimate what proportion was funded via the Homelessness Prevention Grant, based on the proportion of this Grant compared to other funding committed to achieving the same objectives.
5. How many households have approached the council for support under the Homelessness Reduction Act between April 1 2021 and March 1 2022? Please state in table format how many households were owed a a) prevention duty b) a relief duty 
We are unable to provide figures within Quarter 4 as these are not yet available having not closed the quarter and completed our data quality assurance process. Therefore, the figures below cover the period April 1 2021 to December 31 2021.

· 3692 households approached the council

· 1911 of these led to homeless persons’ applications being raised

· The remainder were either provided with advisory services and/or signposted to other services

We would suggest you place a subsequent request 2 months following close of Quarter 4.


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
