Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Highway Bond Provision

1. Please could you confirm which of these individual elements your Authority includes within your bond requirement for all highways work for S278 and S38 agreements? Please use the tick boxes provided.

	Elements
	S278
	S38

	
	YES
	NO
	YES
	NO

	All elements
	√
	☐
	√
	☐

	Carriageways
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Cycleways
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Drainage
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Earthworks
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Footways/paths
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Fencing
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Highway Retaining Structures
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Kerbing
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Landscaping
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Road Construction 
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Road Works
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Service Strips
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Signage
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Street Furniture
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Street Lighting
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Traffic Calming
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Traffic Signals
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Trees
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Verges
	☐
	☐
	☐
	☐

	Do not hold information
	☐
	☐

	Not applicable 
	☐
	☐

	Other/Additional Comments: 


2. Please could you provide the total bond value for S278 and S38 agreements for the past 3 financial years, and the total number of bonds completed in each year?

	
	S278
	S38

	Financial Year
	2018-2019
	2019-2020
	2020-2021
	2018-2019
	2019-2020
	2020-2021

	Total bond value
	Nil
	£1,744,701
	£191,908
	£3,617,631
	Nil
	£532,271

	Total number of completed bonds
	
	3
	2
	5
	
	2

	Additional Comments:


3. Please confirm what items of adoptable highway infrastructure currently attract commuted sums, and what are the individual costs?

	Item of adoptable highway infrastructure
	YES
	NO
	If yes – Individual cost per unit

	Blockwork
	☐
	☐
	

	Bollards
	☐
	☐
	

	Bridges
	☐
	☐
	

	Bus Shelters
	☐
	☐
	

	Carriageways
	☐
	☐
	

	Crossings
	☐
	☐
	

	Culverts
	☐
	☐
	

	Cycle Stands
	☐
	☐
	

	Cycleways
	☐
	☐
	

	Drainage
	☐
	☐
	

	Earthworks
	☐
	☐
	


	Footways/paths
	☐
	☐
	

	Fencing
	☐
	☐
	

	Highway Retaining Structures
	☐
	☐
	

	Hydrobrakes
	☐
	☐
	

	Illuminated Signage 
	☐
	☐
	

	Kerbing
	☐
	☐
	

	Landscaping
	☐
	☐
	

	Paving
	☐
	☐
	

	Retaining Walls
	☐
	☐
	

	Road Construction 
	☐
	☐
	

	Road Works
	☐
	☐
	

	Service Strips
	☐
	☐
	

	Signage
	☐
	☐
	

	Soakaways
	☐
	☐
	

	Street Furniture
	☐
	☐
	

	Street Lighting
	☐
	☐
	

	Swale Maintenance
	☐
	☐
	

	Traffic Calming
	☐
	☐
	

	Traffic Signals
	☐
	☐
	

	Trees
	☐
	☐
	

	Verges
	☐
	☐
	

	Do not hold information
	☐

	Not applicable 
	☐

	Other/Additional Comments: In line with the Highways Act 1980 our developer agreements may contain provisions for commuted sums for future maintenance and are not limited by the Act.  




4. Please could you confirm your inspection fee or percentage applicable relevant to the bond provision for S278 and S38 agreements?

	S278
	S38
	Both

	Fees
	Percentage
	Fees
	Percentage
	Fees
	Percentage

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Additional Comments: Our fees for Section 38 and 278 agreements under the Highways Act 1980, are detailed in our Minor Fees and Charges for Transportation Services on our website. 

https://www.leicester.gov.uk/transport-and-streets/roads-and-pavements/
This is therefore a refusal in accordance with Section 21 of the Act, information publicly available.



Highway S38/S278 Timescales

Section S278 Agreements relating to residential developments during each of the past 3 financial years.

1. Please could you confirm the average time taken to from a technical submission to technical approval?

	S278 – Average time from Technical Submission to Technical Approval.

	Financial Year
	2018-2019
	2019-2020
	2020-2021

	Average time in weeks
	
	
	

	Additional Comments:


2. Please could you confirm what is the average time from technical approval to the completion of a Section 278 legal engrossment?

	S278 – Average time from Technical Approval to completion of Legal Engrossment.

	Financial Year
	2018-2019
	2019-2020
	2020-2021

	Average time in weeks
	
	
	

	Additional Comments:


3. Please could you confirm the average time to grant a Streetworks Permit, post execution of Legal Engrossment?

	S278 – Average time to grant a Street Works Permit, post Legal Engrossment.

	Financial Year
	2018-2019
	2019-2020
	2020-2021

	Average time in weeks
	
	
	

	Additional Comments:


In respect of Qs1-3 above, the Council does not hold average time values.  This is therefore a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, information not held by Leicester City Council.

Section 38 Road Adoptions relating to residential developments during each of the past 3 financial years.

1. Please could you confirm what is the average time taken from technical submission to a response to the submission?

	S38 – Average time from Technical Submission to a response to the submission.

	Financial Year
	2018-2019
	2019-2020
	2020-2021

	Average time in weeks
	
	
	

	Additional Comments:


2. Please could you confirm what is the average time taken from the response to Technical Approval?

	S38 – Average time from the response to Technical Approval.

	Financial Year
	2018-2019
	2019-2020
	2020-2021

	Average time in weeks
	
	
	

	Additional Comments:


3. Please could you confirm what is the average time taken from Technical Approval to the completion of a Section 38 legal agreement?

	S38 – Average time from Technical Approval to Legal Agreement.

	Financial Year
	2018-2019
	2019-2020
	2020-2021

	Average time in weeks
	
	
	

	Additional Comments:


4. Please could you confirm what is the average time taken from the completion of a Section 38 legal agreement to the commencement of the maintenance period?

	S38 – Average time from Legal Agreement to commencement of the Maintenance Period.

	Financial Year
	2018-2019
	2019-2020
	2020-2021

	Average time in weeks
	
	
	

	Additional Comments:


5. Please could you confirm what is the average time taken from the commencement of the maintenance period to the date of formal adoption?

	S38 – Average time from Commencement of the Maintenance Period to Formal Adoption.

	Financial Year
	2018-2019
	2019-2020
	2020-2021

	Average time in weeks
	
	
	

	Additional Comments:


6. Please could you confirm the average time from the issue of the Final Certificate to the cancellation of the bond?

	S38 – Average time from issue of Final Certificate to cancellation of the bond.

	Financial Year
	2018-2019
	2019-2020
	2020-2021

	Average time in weeks
	
	
	

	Additional Comments:


With regards to Qs 1-6 above, the average time values are not held by the Council and as such this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, information not held.

7. If you reduce the value of the bond as a development progresses at what stages do you reduce the value, and by what percentage?
	Stage the value is reduced 
	Percentage of reduction

	On issue of maintenance certificate
On adoption
	bond reduced by 90%

bond released

	Additional Comments:


The Council is happy to engage in dialogue with the HBF over its approach to highway adoptions.   

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
