FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I would like to request information regarding fly-tipping over the past 10 years. 

Specifically, I am requesting:
1. The number of fly-tipping incidents reported each year.  
	2025/26
	4,385 to November 25

	2024/25
	6,966

	2023/24
	7,432

	2022/23
	6,285

	2021/22
	8.321

	2020/21
	9,999

	2019/20
	8,416

	2018/19
	8,061

	2017/18
	8,512

	2016/17
	8,716

	2015/16
	8,252


2. The number of these incidents involving mattresses, if recorded.  
We do not itemise the materials collected. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3. The cost to the council for collection and disposal of fly-tipped items.  
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
These costs are not individually collated, they form part of the wider role of the Cleansing Services team and are one of their many duties/functions.   
If some of this data is not held or not recorded, please advise. If possible, please provide the information in a spreadsheet or table format

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
