FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Original request: 

Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I would like to request the following information for your local borough. 

Please provide the information in the attached excel format which asks for the following. If it’s not possible to fill in the spreadsheet, please provide the information in a word document.

Please may you provide me with:

1. The total service expenditure for the local authority for financial year 2022, 2023 and 2024 to date
For your information this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, the Council Website, and is already in the public domain.

Budgets Budget summaries (leicester.gov.uk)
2. The total expenditure allocated to culture and related services budget in 2022, 2023 and 2024 to date. Culture and related community services may include but not limited to libraries, sports centres, arts facilities, parks, etc.
Actuals – the out-turn reports.

2021/22 Executive decisions (leicester.gov.uk)
2022/23 Executive decisions (leicester.gov.uk)
2023/24 Executive decisions (leicester.gov.uk)
3. The number of closures reported in your area for local community services or facilities over the past five years from 1st January 2019 – 31st August 2024. Local and community spaces may include but not limited to libraries, sports facilities, arts venues
Please see the attached completed spreadsheet in relation to libraries, sports facilities, parks and arts venues.  These budgets are specific to the service areas.  For example, the budget summary information for parks in response to question 1 includes Bereavement Services, Trees & Woodlands, Landscape Services and Cleansing Services.  The attached is specific to park facilities.
As previously explained, we are only able to provide information in relation to Council owned services, we do not hold information relating to closures of independently operated community projects, sports facilities etc. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Clarification received:

Please find a list of the services we require budget information for here: 

· Education 

· Highways and transport 

· Highways and transport services (excl GLA)

· Highways and transport services (GLA only)

· Children’s Social Care

· Adult Social Care 

· Public Health 

· Housing (excluding Housing Revenue Account)

· Homelessness 

· Cultural, environmental and planning

· Police 

· Fire & rescue 

· Central services 

· Other services

And a list of community services here: 

· Libraries

· Sports facilities

· Arts venues and facilities 

· Parks

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
