FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1) Do you have a dedicated annual budget for flood remediation? If so, please state it in pounds. 
Over recent decades the city council and its partners have spent many tens of millions of pounds on flood prevention.

The city council allocates £300,000 capital per annum and £415,000 revenue per annum

2) What was your annual dedicated budget for flood remediation last year? Please state your answer in pounds. 
Last year, the city council allocated £300,000 capital per annum and £415,000 revenue per annum.

3) In the last ten years, how many floods have you had from surface water/fluvial flooding? (Surface water/fluvial flooding is defined as “flooding that occurs when the volume and intensity of rainfall overwhelms local drainage systems.”; a flood is defined as “any case where land not normally covered by water becomes covered by water”). 
There has been numerous heavy rainfall events that lead to  flooding of low lying green spaces, flood plains and reports of highway ponding, but we don’t record these specifically. For example, Braunstone Lane East in the city floods periodically when river levels are high. 

However, we have noted the following significant flooding event that led to property flooding as follows:

· 28th June 2012 Thunderstorm over Leicester West – mainly highway surface water flooding​ & 13 properties affected. 

· 14th June 2016 Thunderstorm over South / South-east Leicester – highway surface water flooding​ & 12 properties affected. 

· 22nd June 2023 Thunderstorm over South and East Leicester – highway surface water flooding & 82 properties​ affected. 

· 2nd January 2024 Storm Henk – 151 properties affected by flooding from the River Soar and tributaries​. 

· 6th January 2025 – 183 properties affected by flooding from the River Soar and tributaries​. 

4) What was the cost to the council of the repairs and cleanup of your most recent flood (as per the definition above)? 
We do not have this information as our response is a business as usual activity within existing budgets and is not recorded separately.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
4) Which of the following have you planned to invest in to remediate floods? Please select all that apply. 

a. Options:

i. Installing Sustainable Drainage Systems (SuDS). 
We are bringing forward plans to install SUDS in a number of schools.

ii. Require all news builds/developments to include SuDS. 
Our Planning Service works closely with developers to ensure sustainable drainage features are embodied within development proposals.  Please see Sustainable Drainage Systems (SuDS)
iii. Increasing drainage maintenance. 
We have increased expenditure on highway drainage maintenance.

iv. Enhance green spaces to improve drainage and act as a natural buffer. 
Working with our partner the Trent Rivers Trust we have secured £834,000 to deliver Natural Flood Management schemes. Funding secured for natural flood management scheme
v. Plant trees to help absorb excess rainwater 
vi. Engage with home/land owners to reduce paved space. 
Planning permission is required for paved areas to the front of housing where the impermeable area is greater than 5sq.m. Apply for a dropped kerb
5) Have any of the floods your council has experienced in the last ten years resulted in “sewer flooding”, where sewers become overwhelmed? 
Yes – please see 3 above. In Leicester, sewer flooding is the responsibility of Severn Trent Water. Please also see

Flooding and watercourses for details of section 19 investigations.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
