Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Aylestone parking scheme
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

A consultation is currently open for a residents parking scheme in the Aylestone area. 

The proposed scheme will cost residents £25/year for a permit and an additional £30/year for a visitors permit. 

Leicester City Council currently provides permits across permanent residential parking schemes at the following cost: 

Residents parking permit with vehicle registration £25 

Visitors parking permit without vehicle registration £30 

Visitor scratch cards at £2 each

Residents parking schemes are implemented after significant consultation therefore the Council is unable to determine permit eligibility and costs until the scheme has followed the council’s approved process.  

There are currently 10 permanent residents parking schemes located in the following areas:
Holy Trinity

Hazel

Bede Island

Riverside

Highfields

Westcotes

Alderton Close

Coleman Road

Discovery Road

Roseberry Street

An experimental residents parking scheme is also currently taking place in Clarendon Park.
Please can you provide your economic modelling to demonstrate:

1. The initial cost of implementing the parking scheme.

The consultation responses will be reviewed and only after this can a full proposal for the scheme be assessed to determine implementation costs.

This therefore acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.


2. The estimated income from the sale of all parking permits, in years 1, 2 
and 3. 

The consultation responses will be reviewed and only after this can a full proposal for the scheme be determined and estimates of income made.
This therefore acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.


3. The ongoing cost of administering the scheme each year

Until the scheme is approved and resident’s applications are received the cost of managing the scheme cannot be determined.  As such this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held. 

4. The net additional income generated by Leicester City Council over the next 10 years. 

Refer to Q2 in respect of income forecasting for residents parking schemes. 
This therefore acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.

5. How the £25 / £30 costs were calculated?

The charges were calculated based on costs of operating the service when implemented. 

6. The Council's policy on permit price increases. Will the price increase? Will any guarantee be given to maintain the price? 

The Council is required to consider fees and charges annually. 
Residents parking schemes are intended to be self-financing. 
There are no current proposals to increase charges in respect of residential parking schemes. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
