FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Cofresh Snack Foods, 39 Menzies Road, Leicester, LE40 0JL

Please forward us a copy of: 

1. Records of complaints from local residents concerning odour nuisance from the site from 3 March 2023 to date. We are aware that you will need to redact the personal information of complainants but please leave visible the street names from which the complaints originate. 
09.03.23 – Call to Parker Drive at 10.20 hours, call was cancelled at 10.21 hours

31.03.23 – Call to Parker Drive at 10.35 hours, Officer arrived at 11.00 hours and the odour had stopped.

21.04.23 – Call to Parker Drive at 11.29 hours, Officer arrived at 11.57 hours, and odour was not at a level that was actionable.

26.05.23 – Call to Parker Drive at 10.45 hours, Officer arrived at 11.30 hours, and odour was not at a level that was actionable.

08.06.23 – Call to Parker Drive at 09.08 hours, Officer arrived at 09.59 hours, and odour was not at a level that was actionable.

2. Correspondence passing between the council and the site regarding odour complaints from 3 March 2023 to date; the investigations of source of odour and measures taken to abate the odour from 3 March 2023 to date. 
None, therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

3. Any notices served on the operator in relation to odour nuisance from the site between 3 March 2023 to date. 
None, therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

4. Any records, attendance notes, memos, reports (or similar) relating to the monitoring/site inspections/site visit carried out in relation to odour nuisance from the site from 3 March 2023 to date. 
None, therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

5. Any Odour monitoring, Sniff test and/or AQ monitoring records submitted to the council for the period from 3 March 2023 to date. 
None, therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

6. Copies of any updates produced by Cofresh and/or the Council to the local community concerning odours from the Site. 

None, therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
