Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: nuisance complaints
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Please provide the following information regarding nuisance complaints received by the council in the year 2024. This is likely to be held by the council's environmental health department. 

1. The number of odour complaints received by the council where possible broken down into the following categories:
Answer:

42


• Sewage Treatment Works
• Sewage Sludge Spreading
• Farm Premises
• Manure/slurry Spreading
• Commercial Kitchens
• Waste reception/processing/disposal;
• Other
A breakdown of the complaints in the categories requested is not held.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

Please also provide the number of abatement notices issued in 2024 relating to odour.

No abatement notices have been served for these complaint types in this period. 


2. The number of dust complaints received by the council where possible broken down into the following categories:
3


• Construction
• Waste
• Agricultural Land
• Mineral Excavations
• Other

We are unable to give a breakdown of the complaints as requested.  Exemption section 1.1 of the Act applies, information not held.
Please also provide the number of abatement notices issued in 2024 relating to dust.

No abatement notices have been served for these complaint types in this period. 


3. The number of smoke complaints received by the council where possible broken down into the following categories:
214
• Domestic bonfire
• Construction sites
• Agricultural
• Other 
We have broken down as per the categories we have:

PNABON (Allotment Bonfire) - 7

PNDBON (Domestic Bonfire) - 161

PNDSCA (Domestic Smoke (Chimney)) - 8

PNIBON (Industrial / Commercial Bonfire) - 32

PNICHM (Smoke from Non Domestic Chimney) - 3

PNISCA (Smoke from Industrial Chimney) - 3

Please also provide the number of abatement notices issued in 2024 relating to smoke.
No abatement notices have been served for these complaint types in this period. 


4. The number of Fume or Gases complaints received by the council in 2024. 

2
Please also provide the number of abatement notices issued in 2024 relating to fumes or gases.

No abatement notices have been served for these complaint types in this period. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
