 FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request information which may be found within your Education, Children's Services or Insurance/Finance Department.

I write to request information regarding and relating to any ‘staff absence insurance/mutual/pooling’ schemes that are ran by or on behalf of the authority for schools & academies in your authority. Please could you kindly provide answers to the following:

1) Does the Authority currently provide a staff absence protection scheme for schools?

2) If the Authority does not provide such a scheme:

a. Has the Authority historically provided a staff absence protection scheme for schools? 

b. If so, when did the provision of this scheme cease?

3) If the Authority does provide a staff absence protection scheme: 

a. Is the scheme outsourced to another provider

b. delivered directly by the Authority?

4) If the scheme is outsourced to another provider either via tender or direct appointment: 

a. Which provider is responsible for the scheme?

b. When does the current agreement with this provider expire?

5) Who within the Authority is responsible for the management of the staff absence protection scheme?

6) If the scheme is provided directly by the Authority, please provide detailed information about the scheme, including: 

a. The daily benefit amount reimbursed for each category of staff. 

b. The waiting period applied to each claim. 

c. Any exclusions to the scheme, with details of such exclusions.

d. Any maternity related cover options

7) When is the renewal date for the schools participating in the scheme?

8) Is there an opt-in date for schools prior to the renewal date?

9) How is the price of the scheme determined for each school?

10) How many schools are currently participating in the scheme?

11) For the scheme year 2024: 

a. The total contributions made to the scheme. 

b. The total claims payments made from the scheme.

If you require any clarification to any of the above questions then please don’t hesitate to ask. 

Response: 
Leicester City Council does not hold the information you have requested. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

Therefore, please be advised to redirect your request to individual schools who may be able to assist. Please contact individual schools directly. The link below will take you to the Schools’ Directory page:  

https://schoolinfo.leicester.gov.uk/DirectorySearch.html
You can find detailed contact information for all Leicester City schools using the search facility ‘School Type’ in the form.  

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.


If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk

Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
