Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: public toilets
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. Please provide the following information for the listed years:

2010/11, 2011/12, 2012/13, 2013/14, 2014/15, 2015/16, 2016/17, 2017/18, 2018/19, 2019/20, 2020/21, 2021/22, 2022/23, 2023/24, 2024/25
a. Number of public toilets open for use
b. Number of toilets operated or owned by the council
Answer:
Following are the number of toilets operated and managed by the Council.  We are unaware of private provision (shops, bars, restaurants etc.)
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c. Annual cleaning costs for public toilets
This information is not held.  We don’t have a breakdown of time or cost spent on this particular activity.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

d. Annual budget for street cleaning



£

2010

3,630,900

2011

3,141,300

2012

3,224,600

2013

3,276,200

2014

3,560,400

2015

2,638,900
2016

2,772,800
2017

2,622,600
2018

2,595,700
2019

2,482,000
2020

2,524,400
2021

2,632,200
2022

2,747,900
2023

2,952,800
2024

3,205,700
2. Please provide the following information for 2024/25:
1. Average length of time that public toilets are open (in hours)
Public toilet opening hours vary depending on location, see attached link for a guide: Public toilets.  The exemption to disclosure contained at section 21 of the Act -Information Accessible to the Applicant by other means is engaged in respect of this request.

2. Shortest length of time that any public toilet is open (in hours)
See 2a above

3. What are the main reasons given for closing public toilets?

The main reason for closing public toilets is anti-social behaviour, drug and sexual activity and arson, or disposal of the building containing the public toilet.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
