Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: empty homes
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked for:
1. A list of all residential properties within your local authority area that are currently recorded as:

   a) Long-term empty (unoccupied for more than 6 months)

   b) Subject to an Empty Homes Premium for Council Tax

   c) Exempt from Council Tax under any empty property exemption category (e.g., Class C, Class D, Class F, etc.)

Answer:
This letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is already in the public domain.
The Council publishes aggregated data on empty properties, exemptions, and premiums through the statutory Council Taxbase return, which is submitted annually to central government.

The most recent published data is available at: Council Taxbase 2025 in England - GOV.UK
This return provides summary-level totals for long-term empty properties, empty homes premiums, and exemption categories at local authority level. It does not provide property-level details or addresses.
2. For each property, please provide:

   - Full postal address (or, if you consider this disclosable only in part, the maximum level of detail permissible such as street name and postcode sector)

   - The date on which the property was first recorded as empty, or if this is not held, the total length of time (in months or years) that the property has been recorded as empty

   - The applicable Council Tax class, exemption, or premium

Information is not held in a reportable format.
While the Council holds Council Tax records relating to empty properties, exemptions, and premiums, this information is not held in a single reportable dataset in the format requested. The relevant data is spread across multiple fields and reports within the Council Tax system.

There is no existing report that produces a property-level list showing addresses, emptiness start dates or durations, and exemption or premium classifications together.
Section 12 – Cost of compliance

To comply with this request, the Council would be required to manually review and extract information from a very large Council Tax report containing more than 20,000 records, in order to:
· Identify properties meeting the criteria in your request

· Determine applicable exemption or premium status

· Establish the date or duration of emptiness 

· Compile the information into a new dataset.

This would involve significant manual intervention and restructuring of data and would exceed the 18-hour / £450 cost limit prescribed under the Freedom of Information Act 2000.

Accordingly, the Council has determined that complying with your request in its current form would exceed the appropriate limit under Section 12(1) of the Act.

This therefore constitutes a Refusal Notice under Section 17(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.
You may wish to refine and resubmit your request so that it reduces the cost to within the 'appropriate limit'.

3. Please also provide:

   - The number of properties currently under consideration for, or subject to, an Empty Dwelling Management Order (EDMO)
The Council currently has no active EDMOs and no properties under consideration for an EDMO.

   - The number of properties currently under consideration for, or subject to, Compulsory Purchase relating to long-term emptiness

The Council currently has no active CPOs relating to long-term empty residential properties.

 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
