Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.
1. How many children were taken into care in your County each year for the past 10 years? 
The figures are recorded by financial year.

	2012
	2013
	2014
	2015
	2016
	2017
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021

	215
	205
	203
	219
	253
	271
	246
	187
	194
	151


2. How many children in care in your county attempted or succeeded in committing suicide each year for the past 10 years?
Nil deaths

3. How many children in your county in care were diagnosed with mental health issues each year for the past 10 years?

4. How many parents committed suicide in your county during or after social services involvement each year for the past 10 years ?

5. How many parents who had their children removed from them by social services in your county have been diagnosed with mental health issues each year in the past 10 years?
In response to questions 2,3,4 and 5:

This information is either not held by Leicester City Council or it is not feasible to collate the data requested within the 18 hour limit prescribed by the Act.  Therefore, the following exemptions are applicable:

Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council and;

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

Staff would be required to trawl through each individual care record to collate the information requested.  Whether the child or parents had a mental health diagnosis, whether the child or parents had attempted suicide.  This information is simply not recorded in a reportable format.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.

6. How many complaints have been filed against social services in your county each year for the past 10 years
The figures are recorded by financial year and relate to statutory complaints about children’s social care.

	2012
	2013
	2014
	2015
	2016
	2017
	2018
	2019
	2020
	2021

	74
	61
	66
	67
	89
	104
	115
	90
	85
	54


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
