Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: electric vehicle charging points
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. The total number of EV charging stations installed each year, from 2015-2022
Answer:
The number of charging sockets installed by the Council:

2015
0
2016
15, across five depots
2017
4 Victoria Park car park, 2 extra at City Hall depot
2018
0
2019
0
2020
7 for Leycroft Road depots, 1 for Abbey Park depot, 7 home chargers for Housing staff
2021
22 On-Street Residential Charging Scheme, Chargemaster replacements; 16 at Park & Rides and 8 between Dover St & Newarke St car parks
2022
2 St Matthews Estate

2. The current number of installed EV charging stations in your authority area

The publicly available chargers in Leicester, (both provided by the Council and by the private sector), are shown on Map of electric charging points for electric cars UK: Zapmap (zap-map.com). 
This shows the 50 charging sockets the Council has so far installed for public use; including 22 ‘slow’ chargers on residential streets.

3. The proposed number of EV charging stations to be installed in 2023

The Council is currently creating a further 20 charging bays at four city parks which are expected to be available later in the summer. 
In the autumn a further 38 charging bays are expected to come online, in and around the city centre.
Both these projects will feature a mixture of rapid and fast chargers.

4. The average cost of installing an EV charging station

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

An average installation cost is fairly meaningless on its own as there are so many variables including; the number of sockets involved and their power rating/s, the distance from the charge points to the power source and how much of this involves ‘hard digging’ through concrete/tarmac, and whether a new or upgraded power supply is required.  Installation costs for rapids are likely to be significantly higher than for fasts. 

Recent installation quotes for one rapid socket and two fast sockets were c.£22k and c.£10k respectively.

5. The total number of planning applications for private EV charging stations that have been approved for each year, from 2015-2022

Private – existing individual residential properties, with off-road parking; no planning permission needed. 
Private – existing individual residential properties without off-road parking; we have c.140 charge point requests in this category, where planning permission may be required. 
We are investigating charging solutions for these locations as part of our Local Electric Vehicle Infrastructure funding application to be submitted to the Government’s Office for Zero Emission Vehicles later this year.

From planning application descriptions, seven sites have been identified where we have granted planning permission since 2015 for development which specifically include electric vehicle charging bays in those descriptions:

1 in 2016, 
1 in 2020, 
2 in 2022 and 
3 in 2023. 
Two of these relate to commercial premises, 1 to a sports venue, 3 to car parks at retail centres and 1 to a residential development. 
There will be other sites where electric charging points have been provided within parking areas of development proposals but where these are not specifically included in the descriptions, it would take many hours of checking reports and conditions of approved applications.  To collate this data would exceed the cost limit prescribed in the Freedom of Information Act. 

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, along with locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

This is therefore a refusal under the provisions of Section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

You may wish to refine your request by narrowing its scope by being more specific. 
The total number of planning applications that are in progress (to date) for private EV charging stations

As individual applications are processed it is usual now to seek a number of charging points in shared car parking areas although we have no planning policy base as yet to seek a specific number.
It is not possible to easily identify applications from our database where charging points have been secured as this relies on searching through officer reports or planning condition wording. 

As above, to collate the information would exceed the cost limit. This therefore is a refusal under the provisions of Section 12.1 of the Act -over the cost limit.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
