FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am just writing to submit a Freedom of Information request to your authority with questions around council tax debt management and arrears. Here are the questions:

The Council holds some of the information you have asked for.

1. Between 6th April 2023 and 5th April 2024, what guidelines did you follow when setting arrangements for constituents to pay Council Tax arrears? (YES/NO)

1.  The Council Tax (Administration and Enforcement) Regulations 1992 Yes
2.  The Council Tax (Administration and Enforcement) (Wales) Regulations 1998    No
3.  The National Standards for Enforcement Agents Yes
4.  Local Council Tax Support Schemes Yes
5.  Income and Expenditure Assessments Yes
6.  Flexible Payment Arrangements Yes
2. Between 6th April 2023 and 5th April 2024, what industry standard tools did you use when assessing an individual’s ability to repay Council Tax arrears? (YES/NO)

1.  Income and Expenditure Forms No
2.  Budgeting Software No
3.  Affordability Assessments No
4.  Credit Reference Agencies Yes 
5.  Debt Advice Services Yes
6.  Legal Proceedings Yes
3. Between 6th April 2023 and 5th April 2024, what % of Council Tax was:

1. Paid on time?  
2. Paid after internal chase activities? 
3. Collected by an enforcement agent? 

In response to questions 3 a. b. and c. above.
Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

We do not hold the information requested in a reportable format.  Staff would be required to trawl through thousands of payments and transactions across multiple systems to collate the data required.  Levels of debt referred to enforcement agencies can also change on a daily basis.
This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.

If you would like any help in refining your request, please do not hesitate to contact us.

4. How much did you spend on collecting Council Tax arrears between 6th April 2023 and 5th April 2024. 

Can you also state the cost per method:
1. Internal chase activities 
2. Enforcement agent 
In response to the questions 4 a. and b. above.
We have a concession contract with an external agency that enforces across multiple areas of the Council.  Again, any officers involved in enforcement would be processing the collection of multiple debts, not just Council tax.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
5.  Do you have its own internal enforcement department? (YES/NO) No
6.  Between 6th April 2023 and 5th April 2024, did you use a benefits calculator to help residents in arrears maximise their income? If so, which tool?
Yes, BetterOff Leicester is the benefits calculator to help residents in Leicester maximise their income

7. Between 6th April 2023 and 5th April 2024, did you use attachment of earnings for constituents to pay Council Tax arrears? Yes
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
