Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004
Re: teacher absences
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.
1. In the 20/21 financial year please state how many teachers were absent from schools in your area for the ENTIRE year due to a stress related illness? (i.e. they did not work in their paid employment for a single day during the last financial year because of a stress related illness). How many of these people were (a) headteachers and (b) assistant/deputy headteachers?
Answer:
The Council does not hold sickness data for all schools under its administration.  It only holds this information for the schools who buy into its payroll system. This therefore is a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information for all schools not held. 

However, when the Council is advised of absences by the schools who buy into its payroll system, it is only intermittently advised of the sickness reason. 
2. How many teaching days were lost to your authority in the last financial year (2020/21) because of teachers (not teaching assistants) being absent from school with a stress related illness?

The Council does not hold school employee’s work patterns and therefore cannot accurately assess which days were working days lost. As such this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held.
3. How much did schools in your authority spend in the last financial year (2020/21) on paying for the provision of supply teachers?
This information is not held centrally by the Council, individual schools recruit their own supply teachers. This is therefore a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by the Authority. 

Please contact individual schools directly. The link below will take you to the Schools’ Directory page:  

https://schoolinfo.leicester.gov.uk/DirectorySearch.html
4. Which school within your authority spent the most money on supply teachers in the last financial year? Please give the name, and address of the school and the amount spent on supply teachers?

Please see above. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
