FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Under the FOIA I requested the following information 

1) The number of small business applications made to LCC for the period of 2020.21, 21-22, 22-23 
	
	2020/21
	2021/22
	2022/23

	The number of small business applications made to LCC for the period of 2020.21, 21-22, 22-23 


	447
	367
	313


2) The number of applications accepted and rejected by LCC
	
	
	2020/21
	2021/22
	2022/23

	The number of applications accepted and rejected by LCC


	Accepted
	417
	305
	265



	
	Rejected
	30
	62
	48




3) The number of applications accepted based on leases provided by the tenant/landlord 
This information is not held by Leicester City Council and this therefore acts as a refusal notice under s1.1 of the FOI Act.
4) The number of application rejected and the reasons for rejection 
Rejected numbers see response to question No. 2 - Reasons for the rejection would be the business did not meet the relevant criteria see - https://www.leicester.gov.uk/business/business-rates/reliefs-and-exemptions/
We do not hold the exact reason for each application on the data base, this therefore acts as a refusal notice under s1.1 of the FOI Act.
5) Accepted and rejected applications ethnicity / cultural background
This information is not held by Leicester City Council and this therefore acts as a refusal notice under s1.1 of the FOI Act.
6) The number of applications whereby inspections that have taken place during this above period
We do not hold this data relating to small business rates relief applications. 
This therefore acts as a refusal notice under s1.1 of the FOI Act.
7) The number of applications which have proceeded to court and been challenged whereby LCC have instructed Counsel to represent 
There have been no cases relating to small business applications that have been challenged and proceeded to court. 

The number of applications LCC currently have challenged, and legal costs associated 
There are no current cases relating to small business rates applications.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
