Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: school teacher recruitment agencies
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Please include the following information for the past five financial years.
1. Total spent by council on teaching recruitment agencies;

Answer:
	Row Labels
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022
	2023

	Hays Specialist Recruitment Ltd
	12,207.31 
	23,206.79 
	18,675.53 
	32,293.24 
	18,805.65 

	Khuluma Ltd
	
	
	
	789.40 
	

	Pierrepont Gamston Primary School
	179.00 
	
	
	
	

	Protocol Education Ltd
	
	19,123.06 
	
	
	

	Randstad Public Services Ltd (CLOSED)
	1,393.60 
	
	
	
	

	Reed
	57,968.95 
	56,176.08 
	266.34 
	-266.34 
	

	Susan Harrigan Speech & Language Therapy Services
	
	
	
	1,484.00 
	

	Total
	71,748.86 
	98,505.93 
	18,941.87 
	34,300.30 
	18,805.65 


2. List of all the teaching recruitment agencies that have been used including annual spend on each agency; 

Please see information in the above table by agency, cost and financial year.
3. Total number of shifts filled by staff supplied by teaching recruitment agencies; 
4. The highest per hour and per day rate paid to recruitment teaching agencies in each financial year stated above. In each case, can you please detail the job category of the role provided. And if there was surge pricing, the reason stated for this. 
We define teaching recruitment agencies to be external companies that are employed to supply teaching staff to schools on a semi permanent/ temporary basis. 
With regard to Qs.3&4, the Council does not hold this information. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Please note the above information if for recruitment of teachers by the Council. 

Schools carry out their own recruitment exercise with no input from Leicester City Council. Schools are their own data controllers. You may wish to request this information from the schools by contacting them directly. The link below will take you to the Schools’ Directory page:  

https://schoolinfo.leicester.gov.uk/DirectorySearch.html
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
