Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Education Psychology
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

1. What is the structural FTE Educational Psychologists in the following grades: 

a. Assistant Educational Psychologists employed on the Soulbury Assistant Educational Psychologise Scale 

Answer:
9.4 FTE
b. Educational Psychologists on Soulbury Scale A 

8 FTE
c. Educational Psychologists employed on Soulbury Scale B 

Senior and Principal Educational Psychologists 4.6 FTE
d. Educational and other Psychologists employed on any other scale 

0
2. How many vacant posts are there in the Educational Psychology Service? 

6 Vacant posts
3. How many posts are filled on an interim or temporary basis by employees? 

6 posts

4. What is the average salary (including on-costs) of employed Educational Psychologists

£54,179

5. What is the average daily cost of employed Educational Psychologists

£214
6. What is the average daily cost of the following categories of Educational Psychologists for the years 2020-2021, 2021-2022 and 2022-2023

a. Temporary Educational Psychologists

0
b. Locum Educational Psychologists

0
c. Agency Educational Psychologists

£682.65 / £684.9 / £706.42

7. What is the total spend on locum/ agency / temporary Educational Psychologists for the year 2020-2021, 2021-2022 and 2022-2023. 

£121,048 / £369,853 / £410,471

8. What is the current and projected spend on Locum Educational Psychologists for the current financial year? 

We do not hold a budget for agency/Locum workers, these individuals are only engaged to cover absence or vacancies.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
