FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am writing to request information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 regarding the lighting within our city, both indoors and outdoors. Given the importance of environmental responsibility and energy efficiency, I am seeking details on various aspects related to lighting policies, energy conservation, and improvements in lighting efficiency. The information will be used for research and advocacy purposes in promoting sustainable lighting practices.

Please provide the following information:

Outdoor Lighting:
a. Details of the current outdoor lighting systems, including the types of bulbs and fixtures used.
Leicester’s street lights are made up of a mixture of LED and other traditional types of luminaire. The LED type luminaires make up 83% of our current inventory. The remainder are comprised of high and low pressure sodium, HID, Cosmopolis, high pressure mercury and fluorescent lamp types of various wattages


With regards to external lighting on our buildings, we have a mixture of Sodium, Metal Halide and LED luminaires

b. Specifications and plans for improving the energy efficiency of outdoor lighting, specifically, any transition to LED lighting.
The scheme to convert our street lighting to a white light source began in early 2013 and was largely completed by early 2016. This involved installing 33,800 LED lanterns and these are controlled by a CMS system. This system allows us to monitor and dim those lanterns to a level we consider suitable with the aim of reducing light pollution, cutting carbon emissions and energy use

Plans and programmes are in place to convert all outdoor lighting to LED on our buildings.

c. Information on any policies or guidelines in place for outdoor lighting, including those aimed at reducing light pollution.
Our street lighting design is always based on BS 5489-design of Road Lighting which includes guidance on the reduction of light pollution


Systems are being reviewed in line with the climate action plan including the run time of external lighting on our buildings. 

d. Any records related to energy savings achieved through outdoor lighting improvements.
We monitor our carbon and energy use and receive monthly reports that compare monthly and annual use in comparison with the previous year.
In terms of external building lighting, this information is not held.   The records held relate to all building lighting.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

Indoor Lighting:

a. Information on the indoor lighting systems used in public buildings, especially during non-business hours.
These are a mixture of predominately florescent and LED.
b. Policies or measures in place to minimize unnecessary indoor lighting, particularly in empty office buildings at night.
Sensors are being installed in the majority of council buildings to alleviate any energy wastage.
c. Details of any use of energy-efficient lighting technologies such as LEDs and compact fluorescents (CFLs).

LEDs are being specified for all replacements with a view to being full LED across all sites.
d. Information on the use of dimmers, motion sensors, and timers to reduce energy consumption for indoor lighting.
Motion sensors and timers are being installed on all system and retro fit control systems are being installed where applicable to reduce energy consumption.


Street Lighting Map:
a. Provide a map or diagram displaying the locations of street lighting within the city.

Aurora shows all of our street lights within the city boundary plotted in individual streets, see link Aurora (lcc.local) 


b. Include specifications for each streetlight, such as the type of lighting, brightness levels, and any shielding used.

Our luminaire specifications are varied and we have more than one supplier of luminaire. The majority of our LED lanterns from the initial installation have a diverse range of drivers installed with a huge amount of different settings, our LED luminaires vary in wattages from 20W to 180W depending on road type and column height. The 83% of lighting stock that are LED will have a brightness level that we consider appropriate for each individual street within the city. This 83% totals approximately 33,800 luminaires and every road in Leicester has an individual lumen output setting applied to it. We have installed light shields where it has been proven to be detrimental to residents quality of sleep

Lighting Policy and Legislation:
a. Information on any local planning policies aimed at reducing light pollution levels.
For your information this letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, the Council Website, and is already in the public domain.  

Adopted and emerging planning policy is in the public domain and can be found on the council’s website Adopted planning policy (leicester.gov.uk) Emerging planning policy (leicester.gov.uk) Leicester Local Plan Examination

b. Any records related to monitoring and progress reports on these policies.

As above.

c. Details of any alignment with the National Planning Policy Framework (NPPF) in curbing light pollution and protecting dark skies.
As above.

Environmental Impact:
a. Data on the energy consumption associated with outdoor lighting within our city.

Please see spread sheet attached for public lighting annual carbon and energy use


b. Information on efforts to cut energy use, save costs, and reduce carbon emissions through improved lighting practices.
The LED luminaires are constantly monitored and lighting levels are adjusted so that lighting levels can be reduced to the minimum safe level within BS guidelines after analysis of data for crime and accident statistics has taken place

Recommendations and Guidelines:
a. Information on whether any of DarkSky International's recommendations or guidelines have been adopted for outdoor lighting in our city.

We use DarkSky UK for information and reference but we are not members of this or any other organisation other than the ILP

Please provide the information in an electronic format, such as PDF or digital documents, where possible.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
