FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
 

1. What was your target for the number of affordable housing units fulfilled through section 106 planning obligations in the financial year April 2022 - April 2023? 

No such specific target in respect of s106 exists- see answer to Q4 below. This is information not held under s1.1 of the FOI Act.
2. How many housing units (all types of housing) were fulfilled in the financial year April 2022 - April 2023 from planning applications where a s106 obligation was in place? 

General Housing Completion data for the year 2022/23 has not yet been compiled and verified. This is information not held under s1.1 of the FOI Act.
3. How many affordable housing units were fulfilled through Section 106 planning obligations in the financial year from April 2022 - April 2023?
None agreed/secured via obligations in 22/23 but 17 Planning gain affordable homes completed.
4. What were your targets for the number of affordable housing units fulfilled through section 106 planning obligations for each financial year from April 2017 - April 2022? 

The Core Strategy sets an affordable housing target of an average of 204 dwellings per year between 2009 and 2026. It says that this target will largely be met through s106, but Council and RSL-led schemes, purchase of existing stock, and other sources will also help meet the overall affordable housing need. As such, we don’t have an exact target figure for the no. of affordable housing units to be delivered through s.106. All we know is that it is less than 204 dpa. Formal s106 Agreement Targets are therefore not applicable.

5. How many housing units (all types of housing) were fulfilled each financial year from April 2017 - April 2022 in planning applications where a s106 obligation was in place? 

The overall completion figures are as follows:

	
	Total New Build Completions
	Total Net Additional Dwellings


	2017-2018                         
	1284
	1954     

	2018-2019                         
	887
	1437

	2019-2020                         
	1139
	1448

	2020-2021                         
	1109
	1080

	2021-2022                         
	 801
	 854


S106 obligations data is not available at this stage. 

6. How many affordable housing units were fulfilled through Section 106 planning obligations each financial year from April 2017 - April 2022?

For 2017/18 there were the following completions:

Shared Ownership – 14

Affordable Rent – 39

For 2018/19 there were the following completions:

Shared Ownership – 69

Affordable Rent – 116

For 2019/20 there were the following completions:

Shared Ownership – 41

Affordable Rent – 77

For 2020/21 there were the following completions:

No S106 Completions

For 2021/22 there were the following completions:

Shared Ownership – 20

Affordable Rent – 50

For 2022/23 there were the following completions:

No S106 Completions

7. How many planning applications, that had Section 106 obligations to provide affordable housing, were fulfilled in the financial year from April 2022 - April 2023? 

One such planning application resulted in 17 planning gain affordable homes completed in 22/23, out of a total agreed contribution for that application/consent of 20 affordable homes (3 due to complete in this financial year).
8. How many planning applications with Section 106 obligations to provide affordable housing, fulfilled in the financial year from April 2022 - April 2023, were impacted by viability assessments? 

5 in total for S106 Affordable Housing obligations where consent granted (NB this excludes applications determined with no agreed s106 due to submission of valid viability assessments).

9. Of those Section 106 obliged planning applications that were impacted by viability assessments in the financial year from April 2022 - April 2023 (Answer to Question 8), how many affordable housing units were removed? 

None. Where viability assessments have been successfully argued no obligation exists.
10. How many affordable housing units that were fulfilled through Section 106 planning obligations in the financial year April 2022 - April 2023 were fulfilled on-site?
17.
11. How many affordable housing units that were fulfilled through Section 106 planning obligations in the financial year April 2022 - April 2023 were fulfilled off-site?
None.
12. How many planning applications that included affordable housing and were fulfilled in the financial year between April 22 - April 23 under section 106 obligations resulted in a fine by the council? 

None.  

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
