FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am writing to request information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 regarding dog fouling in your area. 

Specific Data Requirements (2019-2024):

1. Dog ownership demographics
- Annual total dog ownership numbers

2. Dog Population Metrics 
- Annual total registered dog population
- Breed category distribution

The information for the above two questions is not held by Leicester City Council. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3. Dog Fouling Fines 
- Annual average dog fouling fine (£)
Fines have been issued from 2022 onwards the costs remain the same, £100 


- Annual total dog fouling fines issued (£)
Total dog fouling fines issued 

2022 = x8 FPNs issued total £800 

2023 = x2 FPNs Issued total £200 

2024 = x1 FPNs issued total £100


- Annual total dog fouling fines successfully collected (£)

total dog fouling fines successfully collected 

2022 = Total of £500 Paid 

2023 = Total of £100 Paid 

2024 = Total of £0 Paid


4. Dog Fouling Incident Report
- Annual total dog fouling complaints/reports
- Incident location categorization

The following relate to dog fouling incidents reported through the Love Clean Streets app.

	 
	2019
	2020
	2021
	2022
	2023
	2024

	Jan
	3
	12
	23
	21
	56
	67

	Feb
	9
	4
	19
	15
	42
	83

	March
	6
	2
	12
	17
	52
	81

	April
	4
	2
	5
	13
	50
	61

	may
	6
	2
	2
	12
	28
	46

	June
	4
	2
	2
	17
	52
	46

	July
	4
	0
	4
	4
	46
	48

	Aug
	5
	2
	6
	0
	34
	27

	Sept
	10
	6
	10
	3
	53
	22

	Oct
	7
	2
	5
	12
	40
	47

	Nov
	5
	7
	9
	23
	40
	34

	Dec
	6
	21
	18
	30
	28
	33

	 
	69
	62
	115
	167
	521
	595


Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

The locations are not recorded in a reportable format, staff would have to trawl through all complaints above to then pull out and collate the location data.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.

If you would like any help in refining your request, please do not hesitate to contact us.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
