FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
This is an information request regarding the number of Mental Health therapists in LA-maintained primary, secondary and special/PRU schools. 

Please include the following information for the following years 2022/23, 2023/24 and 2024/25: 

1. Total number of mental health therapists employed each year 
The following figures relate Leicester City Council only staff only.  We do not hold the requested information for each school in the City.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held.

Please contact individual schools directly. The link below will take you to a list of schools within the Authority:

http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council-services/education-lifelong-learning/about-schools/schools-directory/schools-directory/  School ward, head teacher, telephone, e mail etc. is available by clicking on the link for each school.

	Year 
	2022/2023
	2023/2024
	2024/2025

	Total number

	5.5 City Psychology Service (CPS)

17 Social Emotional and Mental Health Team (SEMH)
	5.5 (CPS)

17 (SEMH)
	7.5 (CPS)

18 (SEMH)


2. If possible please provide a breakdown for each year:

· Pay bands and accompanying pay scales

· Job titles

	2022/2023

	Job Title
	Pay scale 
	Pay bands 

	Principal Educational Psychologist


	Soulbury B
	12 to 15

	Senior Educational Psychologists
	Soulbury B
	9 to 12

	Mental Health manager
	LG Band 12
	39 to 42

	Assistant Educational Psychologist 
	Soulbury for Assistant Educational Psychologist
	2 to 5

	Social Emotional and Mental Health (SEMH) Teacher
	UPS
	Bands 1 -3

	Play Therapist trained SEMH Teacher
	UPS 
	Band 3

	SEMH Practitioner 
	LG Band 5


	Spinal point 14

	2023/2024

	Job Title
	
	

	Principal Educational Psychologist
	Soulbury B
	12 to 15

	Senior Educational Psychologists
	Soulbury B
	9 to 12

	Mental Health manager
	LG Band 12
	39 to 42

	Assistant Educational Psychologist 
	Soulbury for Assistant Educational Psychologist
	2 to 5

	Social Emotional and Mental Health (SEMH) Teacher
	UPS
	Bands 1 -3

	Play Therapist trained SEMH Teacher
	UPS 
	Band 3

	SEMH Practitioner 
	LG Band 5
	Spinal point 14

	2024/2025

	Job Title
	
	

	Principal Educational Psychologist
	Soulbury B
	12 to 15

	Senior Educational Psychologists
	Soulbury B
	9 to 12

	Mental Health manager
	LG Band 12
	39 to 42

	Assistant Educational Psychologist 
	Soulbury for Assistant Educational Psychologist
	2 to 5

	Social Emotional and Mental Health (SEMH) Teacher
	UPS
	Bands 1 -3

	Play Therapist trained SEMH Teacher
	UPS 
	Band 3

	SEMH Practitioner 
	LG Band 5


	Spinal point 14


By mental health therapist, I mean counsellors, child or adolescent psychotherapists, mental health practitioners, emotional wellbeing practitioners, therapeutic workers recruited to support pupils with mental health needs, plus anyone else that is specifically employed to work with children with mental health issues.

By mental health, I mean any personnel that is hired to deal with/ work with children diagnosed with anxiety, depression, adhd or any child labelled as having a mental health related reason 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
