FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request the following information from your Local Education Authority. Please may you provide us with the following:

1. How many whistleblowing disclosures have you received over the last two years?
2. Can you provide a breakdown of the whistleblowing concerns received over the last two years? 
3. The current headcount/total number of staff in your whistleblowing team. 
4. The amount of expenditure allocated to your whistleblowing team, department or function that deals with disclosures made concerning the bodies, entities or individuals you regulate, supervise or oversee over the last two years.
5. Any relevant documents or processes you have in place for dealing with whistleblowing concerns over the last two years.
This information is not held by Leicester City Council. Schools have their own whistle blowing policies which they must publish on their websites.   School Governors are responsible for this process and would potentially record the number of whistleblowing complaints they’ve received.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
Please contact individual schools directly. The link below will take you to a list of schools within the Authority:

http://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council-services/education-lifelong-learning/about-schools/schools-directory/schools-directory/
School ward, head teacher, telephone, e mail etc. is available by clicking on the link for each school.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
