Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: council tax
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. Is Leicester City Council bound by English lawn? including but not limited to;

(a) First Act of William and Mary 1688;

(b) Bill of Rights 1688;

(c) Coronation Oath Act 1688;

(d) Act of Settlement 1700;

(e) Loeal Governmen4 Act 1888

(f) Fraud Act 2006;

Answer:
This part of your request is for a legal opinion as opposed to recorded information. Under the Freedom of Information Act this is not a valid request. The FOI Act requires you to ask for identifiable recorded information held by the public authority. 
2. Under what specific laws do you claim council tax is compulsory/mandatory?

The Local Government Finance Act 1992.

3. When was the above law voted into law by Parliament?

This is not a request for information held by Leicester City Council. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.

You may wish to consult Hansard or Legislation.gov.uk

4. FULL profit and loss accounting in respect of all of the following

(a) All pension funds and ALL investments using the proceeds of Council Tax.

(b) Enforcing tax liabilities and charges including court charges minus appeals and damages incurred.

(c) Enforcing any and all policies of Leicester City Council upon the local community.

(d) Enforcing evictions for non-payment of tax arrears upon the local community.

(e) Any and all remunerations paid into the pension funds from Council tax payments to any

and all senior officers of the Council.

This information is exempt under section 21 of the Act, namely the information is already in the public domain i.e. the Council’s website:
https://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/performance-and-spending/statement-of-accounts/ 
This is the webpage that our accounts are published, both prior to audit marked draft and post audit.
Further council tax information is available at:

Freeman on the Land and challenges to the legality of council tax
5. We would like to see the previous 3 years of receipts (full accounting) for where the council tax funding is being spent. We do not want to see percentages but proof in pounds (££) as to where the annual council tax is being spent.

As above, exemption section 21 of the Act applies -information is already in the public domain:

https://www.leicester.gov.uk/your-council/how-we-work/performance-and-spending/statement-of-accounts/ this is the webpage that our accounts are published, both prior to audit marked draft and post audit. 
6. Can you confirm Leicester city council is registered on Companies House under company; 'Leicester City Council ; a private limited company;

a. Who is the CEO or principle agent for said company?;

This information is not held by Leicester City Council but by Companies House.  This is therefore exempt under Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held by the Council. 
7. Can you confirm Leicester city council is registered on Dunn & Bradstreet under company Leicester City Council D-U-N-N-S number: 228219960 known as a-"for profit private organisation".;

As in 6 above this is information not held by the Council.
Please consider your reply as perjury is a serious offence. A simple ves/no will do.

8. Can a council tax liability order be appealed under Court procedure?

Yes, through an appeal to the High Court.

9. Although we are aware of the Council Tax (Administration and Enforcement) Regulations 1992. A regulation is not a law but underpins a law, a very important distinction I am sure you would agree.

Our request is you furnish us with the law under which these regulations sit? This alone could render your claim invalid if no law exists, but we are sure you are aware of that. What law are you underpinning with these "regulations?"

As in 1 above, this is not a valid FOIA request, it is for an opinion.
You have a lawful and legal obligation, in your public office to provide the evidence of material substance that there is a lawful obligation for us to be liable for Council tax. We are not aware of requesting any additional services, outside of your statutory obligations of communal services that we believe is already pay in our income taxes.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
