FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1) How many children attend a private school in your borough?
1927

2) How many children attend an alternative provision?
130 (106 of whom attend other schools for part of their week)


3) How many children attend a specialist SEN school?
1,203
4) Number of 5-16 year olds living in your borough
56335 from Estimates of the population for the UK, England and Wales, Scotland and Northern Ireland - Office for National Statistics (ons.gov.uk) 

5) How many children attend a primary school in your borough?
34,859
6) How many children attend a secondary school in your borough?
22,082

7) How many children are registered as Electively Home Educated (EHE)
627 school age EHE children and young people as of March

8) How many children are registered as Missing Education (CME)
Known to be resident in the city and not on a school roll and considered to be missing from education - 71

9) How many children live in your LA but attend a school in a different LA? (Cross Boarder Movement Data)
2707
10) How many 5-16 year olds are in receipt of child benefits in your borough?

The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
