Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Severe Weather Emergency Protocol
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
For the period 1 June to 30 September in the years 2022, 2023 and 2024, and the period 1 June to 18 July in 2025, please provide the following information for Leicester City Council:
1. The number of times Severe Weather Emergency Protocol (SWEP) was activated during these periods.
2. For each time that SWEP was activated, please provide the dates when it was in place.
3. Basic information about what the council’s SWEP involved during each period that it was activated (e.g. were cooling spaces provided? Was water handed out?). If this information is not available, or providing it would exceed the statutory time limit on this FOI request, please just respond to questions 1 and 2 (above).
4. Number of people that were assisted through the SWEP. If this information is not available, or providing it would exceed the statutory time limit on FOI requests, please just respond to questions 1 and 2 (above).

If providing the information for the whole 2022-2025 period exceeds the statutory time limit for FOI requests, please provide as much information as is possible within the limit, prioritising the most recent years.
Answer:

Please see information in the table below. 
Note, where it is stated ‘no record of activation’ and ‘data not held’, the information is not held by the Council. 
	Year
	No of times SWEP activated during this period
	Dates during this period when SWEP was activated
	Details of provision provided by the LA during this period
	Number of people assisted through SWEP during this period. 

	01/06/2022 - 30/09/2022
	0
	No record of activation 
	Despite SWEP not being activated, all known rough sleepers offered accommodation - even those not normally eligible for assistance.  Bottled water /sunscreen available at reception at the Dawn Centre and also handed out by the outreach team. 
	Data not recorded 

	01/06/2023 - 30/09/2023
	0
	No record of activation 
	Despite SWEP not being activated, all known rough sleepers offered accommodation - even those not normally eligible for assistance.  Bottled water /sunscreen available at reception at the Dawn Centre and also handed out by the outreach team.
	Data not recorded 

	01/06/2024 - 30/09/2024
	0
	Not activated
	Despite SWEP not being activated, all known rough sleepers offered accommodation - even those not normally eligible for assistance.  Bottled water /sunscreen available at reception at the Dawn Centre and also handed out by the outreach team. 
	0

	01/06/2025 - 18/07/2025
	2
	30/06/2025 & 11/07/2025 to the 13/07/2025
	All known rough sleepers offered accommodation - even those not normally eligible for assistance.  Bottled water /sunscreen available at reception at the Dawn Centre and also handed out by the outreach team. 
	6


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
