FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Please provide answers to the following questions broken down into age groups:

(If the information is not recorded in these age groups, please provide the information per age year, for example: under 1 years; 2 years; 3 years etc)

· Under 1

· 1-4 years

· 5-9 years

· 10-15 years

· 16 years +

 

Please provide the information by month for the last full 5 years.

(If the data cannot be provided by month please preferable provide it by calendar year or if not, by financial year.)

 

Question 1: 

How many Section 20s (voluntary accommodation for a looked after child under Section 20 of the Children Act 1989) have been registered for a child leaving adoption in your local authority area? (Either into care, a kinship placement or family/friend placement).

 

Question 2: 
How many Section 47s (child protection investigations initiated under Section 47 of the Children Act 1989) have been registered in relation to an adopted child in your local authority area?

 

Question 3: 
How many Section 31 care orders (under the Children Act of 1989) have been registered in relation to an adopted child in your local authority area? (Care orders where an adoptive placement has broken down).

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

We do not hold the information requested in a reportable format; this data isn’t collated specifically for adopted children.  Staff would be required to trawl through all case files to establish if the care orders, ivestigations, accommodation requests etc. related to adopted children. Therefore, we estimate that locating, retrieving, and extracting this information would take significantly more than 18 hours of officer time and the request exceeds the appropriate limit of the Act.

If you would like any help in refining your request, please do not hesitate to contact us.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
