FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Under the freedom of information act I would like to request some information about a property I think Leicester city council owns. 
1. Is 12 Chadwell Road New Parks Leicester LE3 6LF owned by Leicester City Council.
This letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means.  
Property ownership can be found via the following link:

Get information about property and land: Search the register - GOV.UK
2. Is 12 Chadwell Road New Parks Leicester LE3 6LF going to be used as a hostel/HMO/supported accommodation

3. If 12 Chadwell Road New parks Leicester LE3 5EG is going to be used has a hostel/HMO/supported accommodation could you disclose how many people this property will hold.

The Council does not hold this information. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
