FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
We would be grateful if you could please answer the following questions:

a. How many dedicated FTE procurement officers do you have within the authority?

	Job Title
	Sum of FTE

	Graduate Project Officer
	1

	Head of Procurement
	1

	Procurement Category Manager
	1

	Procurement Manager
	4.9

	Procurement Officer
	3

	Senior Procurement Officer
	3

	DDaT Procurement Manager
	1

	Graduate Procurement Officer
	1

	ICT Procurement Officer
	0.8

	Senior Procurement Officer
	2

	Graduate Project Officer
	1

	Procurement Manager: Adult Social Care & Public Health
	1.8

	Service Manager
	1


b. How many officers have a formal CIPS accreditation and how many are working towards CIPS accreditation
10 CIPS accredited, and, 4 working towards. 

c. What is the total spend of the Authority in the last financial year
Approximately £450m.

d. What percentage of the spend are the Procurement officers able to influence
This information is not recorded. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
e. How many Tenders and RFQs do the team handle on average per year (please base this over the last 5 years to take account of the pandemic skew)
This letter constitutes a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because an exemption under Section 21 of the Act is being applied, namely the information is accessible by other means, the Council Website, and is already in the public domain.  

Tender information can be found here Explore — Leicester Open Data
f. How (if at all) do you measure the performance of the authority’s procurement officers. Examples might be:
Staff receive one to one support dependent on caseload and level of experience.
a. Time taken from receiving the first request to purchase to the placement of order, 

b. cost reduction / avoidance achieved from first offer to order placement, 

c. cost this year compared with last year, or 

d. number of requisitions processed

This information is not recorded. Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
g. Where accounts payable is managed in-house does this function ever sit within the remit of a procurement or commercial specialisation?
No.

h. Do you use any specific metric(s) to govern the size of your procurement team, and if so what are they?

No specific metrics are used to govern the size of the procurement team

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
