FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
To assist in that goal, Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, please could you provide the following information:

a). The number of families presenting in the period November 2024-November 2025 as in need because denied recourse to public funds, and who have been found ineligible for support under Section 17 of the Children Act 1989 because, following a Human Rights Assessment, it has been determined that they may safely return to their imputed countries of origin.
People who are ineligible for Section 17 PFA support are mainly those who are in the UK on Student visa or work visa or they are asylum seekers.  Student Visa and work visa holders are required to work or rely on their own finances as part of their visa conditions. 

They may be open to the Children’s Social Work Teams for safeguarding concerns or Early Help for support but not eligible for PFA support under Section 17. 

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

We do not hold the information requested in a reportable format; this data isn’t collated. Staff would be required to trawl through all referrels to identify these families after they were found ineligible for PFA support and we have advised them about going back to their country of origin.  Children’s Social Work Teams do not do Human Rights Assessments.  

The other category of ineligible families for PFA support are asylum seekers who are receiving NASS support directly from the Home Office, so, PFA don’t get involved.  

If asylum seekers become fully failed asylum seekers, Appeal Rights Exhausted, and living in the Leicester City area at the time of becoming fully failed, then it is the LCC/PFA policy to support the family until they go back to their own country. However, so far, we have not received such cases of fully failed asylum seeker families who are appeal rights exhausted.  

b). The number of families in the period November 2024-November 2025 who were previously provided with accommodation and/or financial support under Section 17 of the Children Act 1989 on the basis of their denial of recourse to public funds, but have since had such support withdrawn, following a Human Rights Assessment determining that they may safely return to their imputed countries of origin.
As above, this information is not held in a reportable format.  Staff would need to trawl through all referrals for the 12 month period to establish the number of cases fitting the above criteria.

c). The number of families accommodated and/or provided with financial support under Section 17 of the Children Act 1989 on the basis of their NRPF status, who have subsequently requested assistance applying to the Home Office Voluntary Returns Service in the period November 2024-November 2025.
None.

d). The number of families accommodated and/or provided with financial support under Section 17 of the Children Act 1989 on the basis of their NRPF status, whose member(s) have subsequently regularised their immigration status, gaining recourse to public funds, in the period November 2024-November 2025. 
Total number of financially supported PFA cases from Nov 2024 – November 2025 are : 35.
e). The number of families accommodated and/or provided with financial support on the basis of their NRPF status under Section 17 of the Children Act 1989 who have been referred by local authority staff to the Independent Family Returns Panel in the period November 2024-November 2025.

Again, Section 12 of the Act is applicable.  This information is not recorded in a reportable format.  Staff would need to trawl through all casefiles to establish the number of families provided with this type of support.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
