FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. What’s the current number of empty properties and long term empty properties across the council, as of June 2? If a figure is not available for June 2, please provide the most up-to-date figure available and state the date for which that figure is accurate. How many of those are owned by the council? What were the numbers as of 2 June 2019, in terms again of empty properties, long term empty properties, and council-owned empty/long term empty properties?
Our data is refreshed on a daily basis and has moved on since June 2nd. This snapshot was taken on the 10th June, the number of empty properties is 376. 
The breakdown of these by ownership is:

·       356 are council owned

·       18 are co owned by the council

·       2 privately owned but managed by the council

The above relates to Council owned/managed properties only, we do not hold this information for privately rental sector.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
We don’t hold detailed data going back to 2019 for a single date, however, we can confirm as at 31st March 2019 we had a total of 336 empty properties. These would have been owned by the Council. These are not necessarily empty for long periods of time but are recorded as empty on the dates specified.
2. How many people were on the social housing waiting lists on those two dates?
As above in response to 1.  We have a total of 6,488 cases listed on the current Housing Register as of the 10th June 2025.  On the 03/06/2019 there were 5,934 households on the Council’s housing register.
3. What’s the reason that the long term empty properties are currently void? Please provide a breakdown by void status – i.e. classifying them as available (Undergoing works, Ready for Occupation, TA: Ready for letting, Long cycle void group, Major Works, Minor repairs), temporarily unavailable (Unauthorised Occupant, Squatted, Capital void, Redevelopment), and permanently unavailable (Demolition, Disposal) or a similar classification method that you use.
Our classifications are based on operational areas, a breakdown of the current 376 cases is as follows:

  

40 properties with our tenancy management teams where notice of termination period has been given.

105 properties are with our technical services teams for Capital / Major Works.

189 properties are with our repairs and maintenance teams to undertake Minor Works to allow the property to be re-let. 

30 properties are with our property letting teams ready for occupation / letting.

We currently have 12 properties that may be considered long term void properties 9 of these are used as Decant properties for tenants that have suffered major incidents such as fire or flood. The remaining three properties are undergoing major structural works to bring them back into service due to subsidence.


We do not have any properties deemed ‘permanently unavailable’.

We do not hold this data for 2019.  We have just recently updated our reporting system to reflect the breakdown by void status.  Therefore, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
4. Since 2019, have you undertaken any work around reducing your long term empty properties? If you have, was this done using internal resources, third party resources, or both?
A voids service analysis was carried out to look at all aspects of the voids journey.  As part of the outcome, the council has allocated additional resources internally to ensure our empty properties are ready for occupation as soon as possible.  For a short trial period the Council used a hybrid model of third party and internal resources to reduce the turn around of void properties.
5. How many properties were brought back into use as a result in each of those years since 2019? What were the average financial costs per property, in order for them to be brought back into use?
We don’t hold historical data going back as far as 2019 for the reasons explained above.

In 2023-2024 we successfully let a total of 812 properties after they had been empty, in 2024-25 the figure was 858. So far, in 2025-26, we have let a total of 102 properties.

In terms of the average financial costs per property to bring them back into use, based on estimates for labour and material costs, the spend would be £3,800 per property.  

6. What work is the council currently undertaking and what is it planning to undertake when it comes to reducing its long term empty properties?
We have an internal improvement plan focusing on processes and efficiencies to reduce re-letting times. This is monitored weekly operationally and via senior management on a monthly basis.

7. Does the council offer financial support, in terms of grants or loans, to Long Term Empty property owners to help them bring properties back into use? If yes, how many owners have made use of that in every year since 2019?
The Council does not offer any financial support for property owners to help them bring properties back into use. 

8. What’s the budget, if any, that the council has allocated for supporting the reduction of empty properties?
The voids budget allocated for 2024/25 is £5,010,400. There are other costs associated with voids, for example, expenditure to cover utility bills for empty properties and additional support staff from other council services. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
