FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am after information relating to the number of potholes and the cost spent on potholes under your jurisdiction.

In particular, are you able to provide me with:

1) The cost to make a pothole safe (temporary repair). Please provide information for the listed years below only. 

2022 

2023

2024 
2) The cost to fully repair a pothole. Please provide information for the listed years below only.

2022 

2023

2024

3) How many potholes were recorded in your jurisdiction for the below years? Please provide information for the listed years below only.

2022

2023

2024

4) Of those recorded, how many of those were fully repaired or made safe? Please provide information for the listed years below only and separate out by whether they were made safe or fully repaired.

2022

2023

2024 

5) What is the most times the same pothole has been ‘made safe’ (temporary repair) in one year. Please provide information for the listed years below only.

2022

2023

2024 

Answer:
The Council holds some of the information you have asked for.

1) The cost to make a pothole safe (temporary repair). Please provide information for the listed years below only. 

We do not hold the cost of a make safe repair separately from a full repair. 

Questions 2 – 4 

Please see attached spreadsheet. 

5) What is the most times the same pothole has been ‘made safe’ (temporary repair) in one year. Please provide information for the listed years below only.

We do not hold this information. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
