Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: chewing gum removal costs
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I would like to request the following information regarding chewing gum removal for the financial years 2019/20 to 2023/24 inclusive:
1. Chewing Gum Removal Costs

1. The total cost incurred by the council for chewing gum removal in each of these years.
Answer:

2019 / 20 
£12,893

2020 / 21 
£32,000 

2021 / 22 
£32,000 

2022 / 23
£52,000 

2023 / 24 
£32,000 
2. Area Covered

1. If recorded, the approximate area cleaned (in square metres) for each year.
Information not held separately. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

3. External Funding

1. Has the council received any external funding (e.g. from DEFRA or Keep Britain Tidy) specifically for chewing gum removal during this period?
Yes

2. If yes, please provide the amount received and year awarded.

2019 / 20 
£2,600 BID Leicester

2020 / 21
£32,000 BID Leicester

2021 / 22 
£32,000 BID Leicester

2022 / 23 
£32,000 BID Leicester

2022 

£20,000 Keep Britain Tidy

2023 / 24 
£32,000 BID Leicester
If Cost Data Is Not Held Separately:
If your authority does not hold chewing gum removal costs separately from general street cleansing budgets, please confirm:

1. Whether chewing gum removal is carried out at all, and

2. If so, whether it is delivered as part of broader cleansing operations.

Our dedicated city centre street washing equipment now incorporates both stain and gum removal as part of its cleaning program
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
