FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. In the following dates, how many bags of litter, refuse and detritus was removed from the areas for which you are responsible.

	2021
	2022
	1st Jan 2023 – 9th July 2023 
	10th July 2023 – 31st December 2023

	
	
	
	


This is information not held. The council does not record the number of bags removed.

2. In the following dates, how much money (or other resources) has been spent/used on litter picking in the area for which you are responsible. 

	2021
	2022
	1st Jan 2023 – 9th July 2023 
	10th July 2023 – 31st December 2023

	
	
	
	


This is information not held. The council does hold a specific budget code for litter picking. The overall Neighbourhood and Environmental Services departmental budget is made up of both staff and running costs. See page 5 here: https://www.leicester.gov.uk/media/50bbavjj/budget-summary-2023-2024.pdf
3. In the following dates, how many FPN’s have been issued by your authority for littering in the areas for which you are responsible and how much money have they generated:
	
	2021
	2022
	1st Jan 2023 – 9th July 2023 
	10th July 2023 – 31st December 2023

	No of fines
	83
	259
	45
	32

	Money generated
	£6,530
	£22,300
	£3,590
	£2,900


4. If the local authority that I am writing to uses littercam cameras or similar to catch motorists throwing litter from their cars, how many fines have been issued as a result of this and how much money has it generated (please break down by the following dates).
The council does not use littercams.


	
	
	2021
	2022
	1st Jan 2023 – 9th July 2023 
	10th July 2023 – 31st December 2023

	No of fines
	
	0
	0
	0
	0

	Money generated
	
	0
	0
	0
	0


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
