Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004
Re: social workers
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.
You asked for:

1. The number of social workers employed by Leicester City Council (broken down by Adult, Children & Families, and Mental Health).

Answer: 

Mental health case work in completed by staff in Locality teams, as well as adult mental health teams. We are unable to separate mental health staff or activity from the wider Adult staffing or activity.

Adult Social Care & Safeguarding

120

Children’s Social Care & Early Help

131
Total






251

2. The number of FTE social worker vacancies (broken down by Adult, Children & Families, and Mental Health) within Leicester City Council's staffing establishment.

The Council currently have 34 agency staff:
9 - Adults
25 - Children & Families 

3. With reference to Leicester City Council's staffing establishment, what proportion of social workers employed by Leicester City Council were employed via an agency?

Leicester City Council employed 34 Social Workers via agency in September 2021, which is 12% employed via an agency.
4. The total wage bill for social workers employed by Leicester City Council for the 2020/2021 tax year.

Basic pay £7,818,241, additional costs (overtime etc) £188,100

5. The total amount spent on agency social workers during the 2020/2021 tax year.

£2,115,934
6. The age demographics of social workers employed by Leicester City Council. Please provide the number of social workers employed by Leicester City Council in each of the following age brackets:

a. 16-26
18


b. 27-39
75


c. 40-49
70


d. 50-59
63


e. 60+

25
7. The number of unallocated social work cases at the time of processing this request (broken down by Adult, Children & Families, and Mental Health).

Mental health cannot be separated from Adult activity.

Adults


1,156 
Children’s 

0
This figure is made up of a number of separate allocation waiting lists, including:
People awaiting a first assessment

People awaiting an occupational therapy assessment 

People already in receipt of care awaiting a review

People self-funding their residential care who’s savings are due to drop below the threshold, asking for LA funding

It should not be taken that this figure refers to people without appropriate care and support.

8. The pay structures for social workers. Please provide the number of social workers employed at each pay band of Leicester City Council’s pay scale.



LG Grade 06


33

LG Grade 07


19

LG Grade 09


173

LG Grade 10


23

LG Grade 11


1

LG Grade 13


1

9. Does Leicester City Council offer social workers Market Forces Supplement payments?

No

a. If so, how much does Leicester City Council offer?
N/A

b. And, how many social workers employed by Leicester City Council are in receipt of this payment?                                                                                                                                                                                                                          

N/A

10. What percentage of the social workers employed by Leicester City Council recorded a sickness absence longer than 1 month in the last 12 months?

13%
a. Of these absences, what percentage were related to stress.

43.57%
b. Of these absences, what percentage were related to workload.

This information is not held.  This is not one of our reasons for sickness.  This letter therefore is a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, information not held by the Council.
11. What percentage of the social workers employed by Leicester City Council recorded more than 3 sickness absences in the last 12 months?

5%
12. The total number of violent incidents against social workers employed by Leicester City Council reported in the last 12 months.
0                                    
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
