Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: supported living
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

 
1) Name and email address and phone number of your commissioners, directors and service managers responsible for: 

a) adult learning disabilities and autism (LDA) 
b) supported living and 
c) digital transformation (health and social care) 

Answer:
The Council can confirm that it holds the details of the officers for the above posts, however, disclosure of personal data relating to junior members of staff below Heads of Service is exempt from release as the Council considers that to be an absolute exemption under Section 40 (2) (personal data), and this therefore constitutes a refusal under Section 17 of the Act. 

The Council judges that disclosure of this information to the wider world under the Act would constitute a breach of Data Protection principles, notably Principle 1-fair, lawful and transparent processing and Principle 2 – processing for specified, legitimate & explicit purposes. 

The Director for the above service is
Kate Galoppi, Director for Adult Social Care & Commissioning, Kate.Galoppi@leicester.gov.uk, 0116 4542373


2) Names of the care provider organisations that you currently contract with to provide learning disabilities and autism supported living services within the county / city and of those, the spend per provider for the financial year 21/22

	Provider(s)
	2021/22 Spend

	Adjuvo
	£22,790.70 (estimated)

	Advance Housing & Support
	£547,086.62

	Affinity Trust
	£3,929,883.24

	Ambient
	No spend

	Care 4 U 
	No spend

	CareTech
	£59,189.86 (estimated)

	Community Integrated Care (CIC)
	£2,880,415.04

	Creative Support
	£1,044,239.66

	IBC Solutions
	£103,024.04

	Lifeways
	£3,644,520.19

	Oakfield (Easton Maudit) Ltd
	No spend (dropped out of contract just after it was awarded)

	Pathfinders
	£966,197.66

	Sanctuary Supported Living
	No spend

	Sova
	No spend

	Voyage
	No spend



3) Total learning disability and autism social care provision spend 21/22

The 2021/22 actual gross expenditure on all Learning Disability services is £56,254k (made up of £47,595k for 18-64 age category and £8,659k for 65 and over age category)


4) Details as follows for any current or planned supported living developments/schemes that provide clustered single-occupancy flats or bungalows in the city / county supporting adults with learning disabilities and autism
Site name or location name (as appropriate)
Provider organisation name
Housing organisation name
Opening date

Please note that the below list is for Leicester City Council developments/schemes only. Information regarding Leicestershire County Council developments/schemes is not held by Leicester City Council and this is therefore a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, information not held by the Council. 
Site Name and Location details have been withheld from disclosure as the Council considers that it is covered by the exemption contained at Section 40 (2) and the first condition of (3) of the Act- Personal Information, where disclosure under the Act would breach Data Protection principles by reason of the disclosure to the wider world of information that could identify the vulnerable tenants housed.  Specifically, disclosure would breach the first and second principles, those of fair, lawful and transparent processing, and those of processing for specified, legitimate and explicit purposes respectively.
Although some of the accommodation is set in a cluster or a scheme, each one is an individual’s tenancy and is the personal home of the individual supported.  
We don’t have a list of when schemes have been put into place. Some of the accommodations are long-standing and may be over 10-15 years in place.  Because the support for the vulnerable individuals is not tied to the accommodation, a list such as this is not something that contracts have.  Therefore, this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1(1) of the Act, information not held.
	Provider(s)
	Housing Organisation/Landlord

	Accredo
	Leicester City Council

	Affinity
	Leicester City Council

	Affinity
	Nottingham Community Housing Association (NCHA)

	Affinity
	Lets for Life

	Affinity
	ASRA

	Lifeways and Knighton Manor
	McDermott Smith

	Community Integrated Care (CIC)
	Progress Housing

	Accredo
	Trinity Housing Association

	Bonney Care
	Private landlord

	Lifeways
	Progress Housing

	Affinity
	NCHA

	Affinity
	Framework Housing Association

	Lifeways
	Leicester City Council

	Floating support – direct payment
	Leicester City Council

	CIC
	Leicester City Council

	CIC
	Leicester City Council

	Creative Support
	Paragon ASRA (PA Housing)

	CIC
	Progress Housing

	CareTech
	Bespoke Supportive Tenancies

	Accredo
	Trinity

	Affinity
	Sangha Lets

	Accredo
	Trinity

	Lifeways
	First Priority Housing

	Sanctuary Supported Living
	Sanctuary Housing

	Affinity
	Progress

	Accredo
	Trinity

	Creative Support
	Creative Support

	CIC
	NCHA

	Pathfinders
	Riverside 



5) Any funding awarded to the authority to support digital technologies within health and social care services within the last 6 months and the name and contact details of the applicant and/or controller of those funds

£0.00
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
