FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, please provide the following information held by Leicester City Council for the 2023/24 financial year (1 April 2023 – 31 March 2024), in digital format.

1. Stray dogs collected under section 149 of the Environmental Protection Act 1990 (“EPA 1990”): total number.

184.

2. Reclaimed by owners: total number.
92.
3. Rehomed directly by the council: total number.
0.

4. Transferred to third-party organisations (rescue/rehoming groups):

- Total number transferred.
- Names of all organisations that received dogs and the number each received.

We hold a total, 51, however, we do not transfer the dogs. The dogs become the property of our kennelling provider on the 8th day and they transfer the dogs.  The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
5. Euthanised: total number, with a short reason code breakdown if recorded (e.g., medical, behavioural/public safety, legal requirement).

38 dogs in total

6 due to illness 

32 due to not being rehomeable 

6. Kennelling/pound provision:

- Name of the current provider contracted for stray dog kennelling/pound services.

Animal Care Services Midlands LTD

- Contract start date and end/renewal date.
Start date 01.10.2025. 

Contract length is 12 months 

7. Due diligence/oversight of rescues:

- Does the council require licensing, inspection, or specific minimum standards for third-party rescues it transfers dogs to? (Yes/No).
No.

- If Yes, please provide the policy, checklist, or criteria used (the latest version).

Not applicable. 

8. Policies/procedures: the current council policy (or SOP) covering the handling, transfer, rehoming, and euthanasia of stray dogs.
Ongoing care of the stray dogs

The Supplier must kennel each dog for the period specified by the Authority. Where the Authority does not specify this period, the dog must be kennelled for the statutory retention period of seven clear days from the seizure unless the dog is claimed by the owner before the expiry of that period. 

The Supplier must provide suitable and adequate meals for each dog and ensure that fresh water is available at all times; individual diets must be catered for and should include proprietary dried or tinned dog meat, or fresh meat as specified in 3.2.1.

The dogs must be provided with at least two 15-minute exercise sessions a day in a secure separate exercise area, adjoining the kennel block detailed above. A record of when each individual dog is exercised must be made and retained. 

All reasonable precautions must be taken to prevent and control the spread of infections or contagious diseases among the dogs. Separate isolation kennels and facilities must be provided with easily cleansed hard, impervious surfaces and must properly drain and maintain an adequate temperature for the dogs. Such kennels are to be thoroughly disinfected and cleansed before each change in occupancy. 

If a dog is ill or injured at the time of receipt or becomes ill or suffers injury whilst in the care of the Supplier during the statutory retention period, the Supplier must ensure that the dog receives prompt treatment by a veterinary surgeon. Subsequent to any treatment, the Supplier must comply with any further requirements the veterinary surgeon recommends in respect of that dog. The Supplier will be liable to pay any veterinary fees incurred relating to the treatment of any dog in respect of any illness or injuries suffered whilst in the care of the Supplier. The Authority will be responsible for all other costs associated with treatment by the veterinary surgeon, however, authorisation from the Authority must be obtained prior to any treatments being undertaken where a single or overall treatment cost exceeds £100.00. 

The Supplier will be invoiced by the veterinary practice and where applicable, the Supplier will invoice the Authority giving details of the treatment and of the dog it pertains to. The Authority must be informed of all treatment within two working days of the start of any treatment. Quarterly reviews regarding levels of veterinary referrals shall take place by the Authority and the Supplier must provide all the information requested within the timeframes specified by the Authority. 

The Supplier must use their best endeavours to ensure that no dog held by the Supplier under this Contract, becomes lost or stolen. 

Disposal of Stray Dogs 
Dogs not claimed within the statutory retention period of seven clear days from the seizure or notice to the owner, will become the property of the Supplier who will assume ownership and responsibility for arranging the subsequent care of the dog. 

The Supplier is expressly forbidden to dispose of any dog to any person or organisation involved with or for the purposes of vivisection, chemical or other experimentation or supplying animals for that purpose to other parties. Any breach of this condition shall be deemed a breach of contract and the Contract will be immediately terminated thereon. 

Where any dog seized under the Act has been detained for seven clear days after the seizure or, where a notice has been served, the service of the notice and the owner has not claimed the dog and paid the amounts due, the Supplier may dispose of the dog: 

 by selling it or giving it to a person who will care properly for the dog; 

 by selling it or giving it to an establishment for the reception of stray dogs; or 

 by destroying it in a manner to cause as little pain as possible. In this case, the Supplier should arrange with the veterinary surgeon for the humane destruction of unclaimed animals. 

Although not a statutory provision, Leicester, like other local authorities, operate a stray dog collection service outside the Authority’s own dog warden service working hours (out of hours), in addition to its day time dog warden service. The Supplier must operate during the contract period a rescue or rehoming centre, attempting to rehome stray dogs that are suitable for being rehomed; the Supplier must have a Rehoming Policy in place by the start date of the contract and operating throughout the contract period. It should be noted that banned breeds cannot be rehomed. Euthanasia must only be carried out by a veterinary surgeon and in a manner to cause as little pain as possible to the dog. 

The Supplier will be liable for all kennelling and incidental fees for unclaimed dogs after the period of seven clear days from the seizure or notice to the owner.

Rehoming procedure 
If the dog is disclaimed by the police force/authority then the process for rehoming can begin. 

During the time at the kennel (after the first 7 days) the dog will see the vet at the next weekly vet visit. A 1st vaccination will be given and a review of the dog’s health undertaken by the vet and any comments noted. 

The dog will undertake a behavioural evaluation. A record of the assessment will be recorded on the Evaluation sheet. A copy of the Evaluation sheet is attached. 

Details about the dog’s behaviour will then be passed to our rescue co-ordinator. She is also advised of any health issues of the dog. 

 The rescue co-ordinator will then get in contact with many rescues scattered all over the country and will begin her search to find a place for this dog. 

Characteristics of the dog are taken on board and a dog will only be placed in a rescue centre which can care for and look after this dog. 

Once the place at the rescue centre space is secured transport is arranged. 

The dog will be transported with the necessary paperwork, vaccination card and medication. The dog will be microchipped if not already chipped and details registered to the rescue. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
