Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: legal disrepair claims
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

I am writing under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request information regarding tenant legal disputes and resolution activity within your organisation, specifically relating to legal disrepair claims brought under the Housing Act (and associated legislation), in your capacity as a social housing landlord.


1. Legal Disrepair Claims
Does your organisation maintain a formal register of legal disrepair claims made by tenants or their representatives (e.g. solicitors)? If yes, please provide:

• The total number of new claims in each financial year from 2022/23, 2023/24, 2024/25.

Answer:

2022/23
409

2023/24
722

2024/25
662
• The total number of claims that were resolved internally without external legal input in each financial year from 2022/23, 2023/24, 2024/25.

2022/23
409

2023/24
51

2024/25
0
• The total number of claims that were resolved through Alternative Dispute Resolution (ADR) e.g. mediation or early-neutral evaluation, in each financial year from 2022/23, 2023/24, 2024/25.

This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by the Council.  

Unfortunately, this has not been possible due to the actions of the claimant’s solicitors. 
• The total number of claims that required support from legal counsel or litigation in each financial year from 2022/23, 2023/24, 2024/25.

2022/23
409

2023/24
722

2024/25
662 

• The total number of open claims/unresolved claims that existed on 1st July 2025?

175

2. Resolution Timelines
Do you record the time taken to resolve legal disrepair disputes or claims? If yes, please provide:
• The Average (mean) and median number of days from first escalation to closure for all claims in each financial year from 2022/23, 2023/24, 2024/25.

This is information not held. This information is not recorded at present, and we have no data to share.  
· The shortest and longest recorded resolution durations (in days) for all claims in each financial year from 2022/23, 2023/24, 2024/25

As above, this information is not recorded at present, and we have no data to share.

3. Financial Costs (Direct Soft Costs)
Do you track financial costs associated with tenant legal disrepair disputes or claims? If yes, please provide:

· The total cost of legal/solicitor fees (£) incurred in each financial year from 2022/23, 2023/24, 2024/25

2022/23
Internal Legal team dealt with or claims £0 

2023/24
Internal Legal teams and an external legal team Part year £316,641.72

2024/25
External legal team £1,182,901.82

• The total cost of mediation fees (£) incurred in each financial year from 2022/23, 2023/24, 2024/25

2022/23
£0

2023/24
£0

2024/25
£0

4. Staff Resources (Indirect Soft Costs)
Do you have staff allocated to tenant dispute management? If yes, please provide:
• How many staff (FTE or part-time) are allocated to tenant dispute management in each financial year from 2022/23, 2023/24, 2024/25.

2022/23
5 FTE

2023/24
8 FTE

2024/25
9/10 FTE

• What is the average annual salary (£) for those roles in each financial year from 2022/23, 2023/24, 2024/25.

£34,314 - £37,035

5. Dispute Tracking Tools
Do you use dedicated software/platforms to manage or track tenant disputes (e.g. housing case management or repairs platforms)? If yes, please provide:

• A list of the systems currently in use and their annual licence or subscription cost (£).

We do not use dedicated software packages to manage or track these claims, outside of the standard Microsoft Packages available as standard. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
