FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Q1) How many bulky waste items were collected in your authority during these timeframes?

1) May 2021 – April 2022 - Total 87,264 items
2) May 2022 – April 2023 - Total 75,135 items

The figures relate to requests made via the online Myaccount portal and not those bulky collection requests made via the telephone. The quoted figure therefore represents 91% of all bookings for 2021 and 86.6% of bookings for 2022. 

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

We do not hold the information requested in a reportable format.  Staff would be required to manually locate, trawl and then collate all requests made verbally for the two year period requested. This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act.

If you would like any help in refining your request, please do not hesitate to contact us.


Q1a) How many of the items collected were sent to landfill during these timeframes? 

1) May 2021 – April 2022 
2) May 2022 – April 2023

Q1b) How many of the items collected were recycled during these timeframes? 

1) May 2023 – April 2022.
2) May 2022 – April 2023

Q1c) How many of the items collected were eligible for reuse during these timeframes? 

1) May 2023 – April 2022 
2) May 2022 – April 2023

This information is not recorded at an individual item level so we are unable to provide figures. This letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
 
Q2) If recorded, what were the top 5 most common bulky waste items collected?
1. Headboard and Mattress (Double/ Single))

2. Bed Base (Double/ Single)

3. Mattress (Double / Single)

4. Sofa / Settee

5. Chest of drawers

Q3) During which month were the most bulky waste items collected in 2022?
August 2022. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
