Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004 
Re: acceptance of cash payment
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:

1. Has the council stopped accepting cash payments in any of the following areas of council business?

a. Housing
Answer:

No

b. Welfare
Descriptor too broad, unable to answer. Please clarify.
c. Tax payments
No

d. Childcare
No

e. Adult education & skills training
No

f. Educational support (such as learning support or council-provided tuition)
No

g. Leisure/sport
Yes
h. Parking
No

i. Health, social care, dentistry or mental health services (please specify)
No

j. Payments to schools (including school meals)
No

k. The council is completely ‘cashless’ (cash is not used for any payments across council business)
Not applicable

2. If you answered yes to any question from 1(a) through 1(j), does the council have records of the number of payments made by cash prior to the cessation of accepting cash? If so, please provide these. If possible, please provide these figures for the three years prior to the cessation, in yearly intervals.

1.g. Leisure & Sport
	Year
	2018
	2019
	2020

	No of Cash Payments 
	180,020
	152,355
	28,188


3. If you answered yes to question 1(g), does the council have records of the number of people who have been refused access to leisure or sport facilities due to being unable to make non-cash payments? If so, please provide these figures for each year since the council stopped accepting cash.
The Council does not hold the information requested. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under Section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

Communications to our customers refer to ‘card only payment’ or ‘pre-booking payment online’ in advance of arriving at the leisure centre.
4. If you answered yes to question 1(j) (that the council no longer accepts cash for school meals), does the council have records of the number of students buying school meals in 12 months before and after the switch to cashless was made? If so, please provide these, broken down by month.

Not applicable

5. If you answered ‘no’ to question 1(g), does your council have any plans to move toward exclusively taking non-cash payments for council services? 

Not applicable

6. Please provide a breakdown of the payment methods used for the services listed in question 1. 

PayPoint. Direct Debit. Standing Order. Post Office. Bank payment (BACs). Internet payment. Telephone payment. By post. Debit card & credit card. Cash. Postal order. Cheque. Pingit. DWP payments. Bailiff payments. 

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
