FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I am writing to request information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 regarding the Right to Buy scheme for council-owned properties in Leicester.

Specifically, I would like to request the following information relating to cases where an independent valuation was requested from the District Valuer, following an initial valuation by Leicester City Council, within the past three years:

1. The total number of requests for independent valuations conducted by the District Valuer.

2. The outcome of those valuations, in terms of how the District Valuer's valuation compared to the council's original valuation: a. The number of cases where the District Valuer's valuation was higher than the council's
b. The number of cases where the valuation was the same
c. The number of cases where it was lower

3. If available, please provide a list of the properties involved in these independent valuations, including:

The property type (house, flat, maisonette)

The number of bedrooms

The postcode (partial postcode is acceptable, e.g., LE3 0__)

The valuation amounts: both the council's original valuation and the District Valuer's valuation

Please see the attached supporting information.


4. Where available, please include any indication or summary of the reasons for changes in valuation, as given in the District Valuer's reports or appeal outcomes.

This information is not held.  The District Valuer simply provides a report of their findings, not a definitive reason for the change or agreement in valuation.  Therefore, this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
