Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: school run pricing and service providers

Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked for:

The top 20 highest per mile prices for school runs conducted under the Leicester City Council tender including the prices charged by the respective service providers.

Answer:
We do not record cost per mile/journeys. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

Once tendered, it is on providers to make selections on routes and put their bids through accordingly. This may answer the question where miles are provided in below table.


For each of the top 20 highest per mile prices, please provide the names of the companies that provide these school run services. If you are unable to disclose the names of the companies, you may use identifiers (e.g., Company A, Company B, Company C) to maintain confidentiality.

As above. But some of this is covered in the below.


Also please give me the top 20 highest-paid school runs per day conducted by Leicester City Council, including the names of the companies providing these services. If disclosing the names of the companies is not possible, please use identifiers to protect confidentiality.
	Mileage
	Notes
	Taxi Provider
	Day Cost

	7.8
	Specialist vehicle, complex health needs
	Provider B
	£164.60

	19.2
	Multiple destinations 
	Provider D
	£143.00

	15
	Specialist vehicle, health needs
	Provider B
	£160.00

	18.6
	Specialist vehicle, health needs
	Provider F
	£209.00

	10.6
	Specialist vehicle, health needs
	Provider D
	£156.00

	6.9
	Specialist vehicle, health needs
	Provider B
	£138.00

	7.8
	Specialist vehicle, health needs
	Provider B
	£150.00

	10.7
	Specialist vehicle, health needs
	Provider A
	£160.60

	16.2
	Challenging behaviour, high needs - harness


	Provider D
	£138.00

	16
	Sharing with other child
	Provider B
	£138.00

	15.2
	Specialist vehicle, health needs
	Provider B
	£140.00

	6.4
	Specialist vehicle, health needs
	Provider A
	£156.20

	11.4
	Specialist vehicle, health needs
	Provider B
	£141.90

	10.2
	Specialist vehicle, health needs
	Provider G
	£157.30

	41.6
	Sharing with other child
	Provider B
	£186.00

	25.2
	Multiple address on different days
	Provider E
	£146.60

	9.2
	Specialist vehicle, health needs
	Provider F
	£176.00

	15.9
	Sharing with other 2 children
	Provider G
	£140.00

	18
	Sharing with other 3 children
	Provider B
	£157.00

	17.2
	Sharing with other child
	Provider C
	£152.00

	4.2
	Specialist vehicle, health needs
	Provider B
	£148.20

	7.8
	Specialist vehicle, health needs
	Provider F
	£160.00

	12
	Specialist vehicle, health needs
	Provider B
	£142.40

	17.2
	Multiple destinations 
	Provider B
	£150.00



I understand the importance of respecting privacy and confidentiality in certain cases. If you find it necessary to withhold the names of companies providing school run services, I am content with the use of identifiers. My primary objective is to obtain accurate and comprehensive information about the pricing of school runs and the service providers involved.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
