Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.
You asked:

I am interested in understanding more about how your local authority manages its provision of “Exempt Accommodation”.  Exempt Accommodation in these questions is defined in legislation, namely accommodation which provides Housing Benefit claimants with exemption from the main HB rent restriction schemes that have been introduced from January 1996 ie: 

• the local reference rent rules; and 

• the local housing allowance rules.


On 1st July 2021 you clarified the following:

‘Temporary Social Housing’ means low cost rental accommodation made available to a person who is homeless, within the meaning of the Housing Act 1996. Generally accommodation such as Bed & Breakfast, or hostel accommodation. 

‘Specialist commissioned services’ would include any specialist services that your authority provides for example: commissioned substance misuse services or Domestic Violence etc.

1) Please complete the following questions below about the cost of exempt provision in your local authority in 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21.

A) How much did you spend on the provision of “exempt accommodation”? 
2018/19 £13,309,507.49

2019/20 £14,667,258.90

2020/21 £15,364,968.62

B) How many HB claims did you receive under the exempt rules? 

The number of “claims received” in exempt accommodation is not recorded. However, the number of live claims in payment during each financial year are as follows:

2018/19 2,010

2019/20 2,151

2020/21 2,012

2) Please complete the following questions below about the providers of exempt accommodation in your local authority for each of the following years: 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21.

a) Total number of providers who received exempt HB funding 

Of which were: 

• Registered Providers (registered with the Regulator of Social Housing). 

• Registered Charities (Organisations registered with Charity Commission but not with Regulator for Social Housing)

• Community Interest Companies (registered as a CIC on the Companies House register, but not registered with the Regulator of Social Housing or the Charity Commission). 

• Local Authority (including those where the Authority is also registered with the Regulator of Social Housing).

• Other
This information is partially retained. We are only able to provide figures relating to those tenancies which are Local Authority, Registered Providers or Other (which incorporates all of the remaining above categories)

	Provider
	Local Authority
	Registered Provider
	Other
	Total

	2018/19
	1
	39
	34
	74

	2019/20
	1
	36
	26
	63

	2020/21
	1
	39
	21
	61



a) Total number of units provided that received exempt HB funding for each of the following years: 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21, of which were provided by: 

• Registered Providers (registered with the Regulator of Social Housing). 

• Registered Charities (Organisations registered with Charity Commission but not with Regulator for Social Housing)

• Community Interest Companies (registered as a CIC on the Companies House register, but not registered with the Regulator of Social Housing or the Charity Commission). 

• Local Authority (including those where the Authority is also registered with the Regulator of Social Housing).

• Other

We do not retain data on “units,” only individual tenancies, as below (with the same delineation of tenancy type explained in the previous answer).

	Provider
	Local Authority
	Registered Provider
	Other
	Total

	2018/19
	257
	1,366
	387
	2,010

	2019/20
	278
	1,469
	404
	2,151

	2020/21
	239
	1,390
	383
	2,012



3) Please can you provide links to or copies of any policy/procedure or guide for the following:

• Strategic document setting out the Authority’s position on exempt HB housing
The Council holds no such document. Our position is as per the DWP Guidance Manual.

• Registration of provider/property for exempt HB claims
Enclosed.

• Periodic revalidation of provider/property for exempt HB claims
As above.

• initial assessment of claims made by claimants for HB under the exempt rules.
The Council holds no such document. Our position is as per the DWP Guidance Manual.

• Validation of exempt HB claims in payment
The Council holds no such document. Our position is as per the DWP Guidance Manual.

• Ending an exempt HB claims by the Authority due to a concern.
The Council holds no such document. Our position is as per the DWP Guidance Manual.

If you have exempt HB accommodation but are unable to provide specific formal documentation please could you set out briefly how you administer each of these scenarios.

4) Please provide information as to the cost to the Authority for each of the following years: 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21.

o Overall spend on Administration of Exempt HB

o Of which was administering exempt HB Claims

o Of which was administering provider or property 

o Of which was enforcement activity associated with exempt HB

This information is not recorded and is therefore information not held.

5) Thinking about complaints or action taken on complaints:

• How many complaints did you receive regarding properties registered for exempt provision in each of the following years: 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21?
This information is not recorded and is therefore information not held.

• How many properties have you removed from your register in each of the following years: 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21?

This is a live document and historic iterations are not retained, therefore we do not hold this information.
6) What was the housing solution for Homeless people who presented to the Authority (or its referral agencies) in each of the following years: 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21? 

• Number housed in exempt accommodation

• Number housed in Temporary Social Housing

• Number Housed in specialist commissioned services

• Number housed in social housing 

• Number housed in PRS

• Number housed in other

Note:  We have taken "homeless people" as its meaning within the definition of the Act - those owed a Relief or Main housing duty.  As such, re-housing occurring within the Prevention period is not included in the figures below.
Note:  We have taken "people" to mean households.  As such, a family of 6 would be counted as 1 below.

Note:  The table below shows the accommodation outcome or current accommodation at the point that the case was closed, so will not be reflective of total temporary accommodation placements over the period.  Those who remained in TA at the point the case was closed would continue to be accommodated and receive non-statutory advice and support services.

	No.
	No. of
	2018/19
	2019/20
	2020/21
	Comment

	1
	Housed in exempt accommodation
	
	
	
	Information not held

	2
	Housed in Temporary Social Housing

Note *
	285
	250
	263
	

	3
	Housed in specialist commissioned services
	
	
	
	We do not hold this data in a way that can be extracted easily **

	4
	Housed in social housing
	246
	250
	192
	

	5
	Housed in PRS
	109
	110
	110
	

	6
	Housed in other
	122
	144
	97
	


 
* Note: This is not a term we use as the term could be very misleading, so we have used requester's definition but advise caution with use of the word 'social' within this term.  It is also contradictory definition as cites B&B as an example, but also cites 'low cost' - the two are not usually compatible so we have disregarded the 'low-cost' part of the definition in order to provide an answer: ‘Temporary Social Housing’ means  accommodation made available to a person who is homeless, within the meaning of the Housing Act 1996. Generally, accommodation such as Bed & Breakfast, or hostel accommodation. 
** We do not hold this data in a way that can be extracted within 18 hours.  It is difficult to estimate the time it would take. The Council does not have to respond to the request under section 12 of the FOI Act if it would take over 18 hours to provide you with the information. Please don’t hesitate to contact us if you need help in refining your request.

7) What is the primary need for Homeless People housed in exempt Accommodation in each of the following years: 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21?

• Ex-offender

• Substance misuse

• Care Leaver

• Young Person 

• Mental Health

• Domestic Violence 

• Refugee Status

This information is not held.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
