Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: incidents involving sharp edges on headstones
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I would like to make a Freedom Of Information request regarding reports of incidents, accidents and fatalities involving sharp/irregular edges or protrusions on headstones, memorials or monuments in U.K. cemeteries over the last thirty years. I wish to specifically exclude incidents, accidents and fatalities relating to fallen or falling headstones, memorials or monuments – it is only sharp/irregular edges or protrusions I am concerned about.


If information is known:

 

1. Please provide the cause, if known, of each accident or fatality.

2. Please provide any details of the sharp/irregular edges or protrusions of the memorials concerned in each incident, accident, or fatality.

3. Please provide the approximate locality of each incident, accident, or fatality.

4. Please provide, in the case of incidents and accidents their severity and whether hospitalisation was required.

5. Please provide the ages of each incident or accident victim.

Answer:
We do not hold any information related to this request due to a lack of incidents/ accidents in the last 6 years or any records of this nature beyond 6 years. 
This letter therefore acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
