Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.
Clarification: 
Regarding Q1 & 2 it is the latter – information regarding individuals funded by Leicester City Council who are placed within the city.

Q4 – You are correct it is Leicester City Council.

1. The number of individuals living in Leicester City Council care homes split by age 0-18yrs, 18yrs-65yrs, 65yrs+ in Residential Care (Learning Disabilities) at the end of March 2021 funded by the Leicester City Council and the Average Weekly Fees per person. 
	Age
	Number
	Average Weekly Fee Per Person

	0-18yrs
	9
	£4,100.00

	18-65yrs
	121
	£1,294.10

	65+yrs
	50
	£1,148.63


2.
The number of individuals living in Leicester City Council care homes split by age 0-18yrs, 18yrs-65yrs, 65yrs+ in Nursing Care (Learning Disabilities) at the end of March 2021 funded by the Leicester City Council and the Average Weekly Fees per person. Also provide a list of those Living in Care Homes within Leicester City Council but funded from outside of Leicester City Council.
	Age
	Number
	Average Weekly Fee Per Person

	0-18yrs
	0
	n/a

	18-65yrs
	0
	n/a

	65+yrs
	2
	£685.50


The Council do not hold a list of those living in care homes funded from outside of Leicester City Council.  Therefore this is a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held.
3.
The number of individuals living outside of Leicester City Council care homes split by age 0-18yrs, 18yrs-65yrs, 65yrs+ in Residential Care (Learning Disabilities) at the end of March 2021 funded by the Leicester City Council and the Average Weekly Fees per person. 

	Age
	Number
	Average Weekly Fee Per Person

	0-18yrs
	4
	£4,400.00

	18-65yrs
	58
	£1,887.26

	65+yrs
	18
	£1,310.77


4.
The number of individuals living outside of Leicester County Council care homes split by age 0-18yrs, 18yrs-65yrs, 65yrs+ in Nursing Care (Learning Disabilities) at the end of March 2021 funded by the Leicester City Council and the Average Weekly Fees per person.

	Age
	Number
	Average Weekly Fee Per Person

	0-18yrs
	0
	n/a

	18-65yrs
	0
	n/a

	65+yrs
	0
	n/a


5.
The number of individuals living in Supported Living Accommodation at the end of 2020/21 funded by Leicester City Council and the Average Weekly Fees.
	Age
	Number
	Average Weekly Fee Per Person

	0-18yrs
	39
	£1,400.00

	18+
	198
	£1,046.60


6.
The number of individuals living outside of Leicester City Council but funded by the Leicester City Council in Supported Living Accommodation (Learning Disabilities) at the end of March 2021 and the Average Weekly Fees per person. Please breakdown into care costs and housing costs.
	Age
	Number
	Average Weekly Fee Per Person

	0-18yrs
	1
	£5,100.00

	18+
	19
	£2,250.21


The Council does not hold a breakdown of care costs and housing costs.  This is therefore a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act, information not held.
7. Please can you also provide me with the following information for 2018/19, 2019/20 and 2020/21:

· The number of new placements into Adult Learning Disability residential services funded by the Leicester City Council and the weekly fee paid for each of these new placements. Please specify whether the placement was nursing or residential.

· The number of new placements into Adult Learning Disability supported living funded by the Leicester City Council and the weekly fee paid for each of these new placements. Please breakdown into care costs and housing costs.
Please find information in the attached spreadsheet. The figures provided relate to individuals funded and placed by Leicester City Council and does not include individuals on Direct Payments.
Breakdown of separate care costs and housing costs is not held by the Council and this is therefore a refusal in accordance with Section 1.1 of the Act.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
