Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004 
Re: Housing waiting list 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1)    Please could you provide information on the number of people on your housing waiting list who require accessible or wheelchair-accessible housing? 
 
Notes: this may be defined as any one or all of the following:
a. We more broadly mean people who need a property that provides ‘level access’ i.e. no steps to access the dwelling and/or a lift or an accessible or adaptable home 

e.g. one that meets building regulations part M4(2) Category 2: Accessible and adaptable dwellings, or any equivalent standard such as the Lifetime Homes Standard. 

b. The number of people who require a home that is wheelchair accessible e.g. one that meets building regulations part M4(3) Category 3: Wheelchair user dwelling or any equivalent standard.

c. The number of people currently in housing who require a minor or major adaptation to their home.  

d. The number of people currently in housing that cannot be adapted to meet their access needs.
 

As of 01/07/2022 there were 527 households on the Council’s housing register requiring accessible or wheelchair accessible housing.
2)   How many dwellings/homes i.e. (the total of houses, maisonettes, flats etc) were built in the local authority for each of the past three years? Depending on your budget cycle, these could be calendar years of financial years. 
 

2019-2020 = Total New Build Completed Figure = 1139 

2020-2021 = Total New Build Completed Figure = 810

2021-2022 = Total New Build Completed Figure = Provisional: 723 (this figure is subject to change as we are currently checking Housing Data for Financial Year 2021-2022)

The total figures are inclusive of houses/flats and our database does not record maisonettes separately. Should a breakdown be required this as this would involve thousands of records being reviewed individually and it would breach the FOI time limit, and is exempt under Section 12 of the FOI Act. This search can be undertaken by yourself by searching the individual relevant records on the public Planning register under Section 21 of the FOI Act (accessible elsewhere) via the following link: Planning applications (leicester.gov.uk)
3)    Of these homes, how many were built as:
a.     accessible and adaptable (Part M Building Regulations optional category M4(2))
b.     wheelchair accessible (Part M Building Regulations optional category M4(3)) 
c.     Another accessible housing standard (if so, please provide details)
These figures are not recorded by the Council’s planning team and therefore this is information not held under the FOI Act 2000.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
