FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
Answer:

The Council holds some of the information you have asked for.
1. The current list of approved suppliers of temporary accommodation that the council will use to procure from. 
We do not hold a list of approved suppliers.
The Council does not hold this information.  Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.

If the council does not hold a list of approved suppliers I would like to request: 

2. The full list of suppliers of temporary accommodation that was procured from in the financial year 2023-24. If data for 2023-24 is not yet available, then this should be provided for 2022-23. 
Abinger Guest House

Alpha Housing

Belmont Hotel Leicester

Blaby Westfield House Hotel

Castle Park Hotel

Centennial Property Ltd T/A The Housing Network

Clarendon House

Croft Hotel

Days Inn Donnington East Midlands Airport

Days Inn Hotel Leicester Forest East

Dingley House

Empire Hotel

Euston House

Fieldhead Hotel Leicester by Greene King

Haynes Hotel

Hilton Leicester

Holiday Inn Express East Midlands Airport

Holiday Inn Express Leicester 

Holiday Inn Leicester City

Holiday Inn Wigston

Hotel Brooklyn Leicester 

IBIS Coventry Centre

IBIS Leicester 

Leicester Aparthotels

Leicester Marriott Hotel

Link Hotel Loughborough

MPS Apartments

Novotel Leicester 

Premier Inn Leicester (Braunstone)

Premier Inn Leicester City Centre

Premier Inn Leicester Central (A50)

Premier Inn Leicester Fosse Park

Premier Inn Leicester South (Oadby)

Premier Inn Loughborough

Racecourse House

Regency Hotel

Rent Connect

Rothley Court Hotel Leicester 

Quality City Apartments

Showcase Apartments / Kimberley House

The Castle Hotel by Greene King Inns

The Gresham Aparthotel

The Nest

The Plough Inn Wigston

The Villaire Hotel

Tranquil Accommodation

Travelodge Leicester City Centre (Haymarket)

Travelodge Leicester Central (Vaughan Way)

Travelodge Leicester Hinckley Road

Travelodge Lodge Leicester Markfield

Travelodge Loughborough Central

Travelodge Nottingham East Midlands Airport

UR Stay Apartments

Voco Leicester

Winstanley House
If the council uses contractors to manage their own stock of temporary accommodation I would like to request: 

3. The current list of approved contractors used to manage temporary accommodation that the council will use to procure from. 
We do not use contractors to manage our own stock of temporary accommodation.
If the council do not hold a list of approved contractors I would like to request: 

4. The full list of contractors used to manage temporary accommodation that was procured from in the financial year 2023-24. If data for 2023-24 is not yet available, then this should be provided for 2022-23. 
We do not use contractors to manage our own stock of temporary accommodation.
For suppliers of temporary accommodation, I would like to request: 

5. For the financial year 2023/24 the total actual spend with each supplier. 

6. For the financial year 2022/23 the total actual spend with each supplier. 

7. For the financial year 2021/22 the total actual spend with each supplier. 
Hotel bookings are made through a third party organisation, so details of spend at each individual establishment are not recorded on our payments system. To establish these amounts would require detailed examination of a large number of invoices which would take longer than 18 hours to undertake. Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.
You may wish to refine your request by narrowing its scope by being more specific about what information you particularly wish to obtain, including any dates or period of time relevant to the information required. We do have a duty to advise and assist you in refining your request under s16 of the Act so please don’t hesitate to contact us if you need help in refining your request.

If data is not available for 2023/24 then I would request the most recent three years when data is available. 
For contractors who are used to manage the council’s own supply of temporary accommodation, I would like to request: 

8. For the financial year 2023/24 the total actual spend with each contractor. 

9. For the financial year 2022/23 the total actual spend with each contractor. 

10. For the financial year 2021/22 the total actual spend with each contractor. 

If data is not available for 2023/24 then I would request the most recent three years when data is available. 
Not applicable as we do not have a contract in place with any supplier.

If your organisation does not hold the specific information described at any question I respectfully request that you provide any information it does hold from which these figures may be calculated. This could include any one database, spreadsheet or word document holding data relating to payments to suppliers of temporary accommodation for the last three years. Please share this excluding any information which could be considered personal information under the Data Protection Act.
You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
