FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

1a) How many SEND Schools do you have in the county?

There are 8 special schools in Leicester City.

1b) Out of these SEND schools, how many have engaged agency Teachers or Teaching Assistants in the financial year ending March 2021?

We are not involved in the day to day requirements of each school and which agencies they use and when.  Therefore, this information is not held by Leicester City Council, schools manage their own supply staff.

2) How many agency Teachers and Teaching Assistants were supplied to these SEND schools in the financial year ending March 2021?

We are not involved in the day to day requirements of each school and which agencies they use and when.  Therefore, this information is not held by Leicester City Council, schools manage their own supply staff.


3) What was the total spend by your organisation on SEND agency staff for SEND schools in the financial year ending March 2021?

All maintained LA schools except Ash Field Academy, submit their accounts to Leicester City Council.  The total expenditure is £155,726.

4) Which agencies do you currently use to supply SEND workers to SEND Schools?

We are not involved in the day to day requirements of each school and which agencies they use and when.  Therefore, this information is not held by Leicester City Council, schools manage their own supply staff.


5) Please provide the name and contact information of the manager responsible for the SEND service that supplies agency SEND staff to schools.
We are not involved in the day to day requirements of each school and which agencies they use and when.  Therefore, this information is not held by Leicester City Council, schools manage their own supply staff.

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
