FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT 2000/ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATIONS 2004 
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
I would like to request the following information as a freedom of information request. If possible please provide the data as an Excel.

By public litter bin I mean a bin provided by the council for the public to put their rubbish in, on the street/park etc.

1. How many public litter bins has your council provided for each of the years 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023 and 2024?
	Year
	Total for highway & Parks

	2020
	2865

	2021
	2865

	2022
	2865

	2023
	2631

	2024
	2658



2. How often have each of your public bins been emptied for each of the years, 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023 and 2024?
This information is not recorded, the frequency varies and is dependant upon cleaning schedules and usage. Therefore this letter acts as a refusal notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 because, in accordance with section 1.1 of the Act, this information is not held by Leicester City Council.
3. How many complaints have you received related to public litter bins for each of the years 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023 and 2024? And if possible, broken down by topic of complaint e.g. not enough bins, overflowing bins.

Service request details below which include overflowing bins, damaged bins and litter bin request.

	Year
	Total for highway & Parks

	2020
	121

	2021
	204

	2022
	216

	2023
	558

	2024
	748


4. What was the cost to your council to provide, maintain, and empty public bins for each of the years 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023 and 2024?

Again, this information isn’t held.  Staff do not separately record the amount of time spent emptying bins.  However, we are able to provide the maintenance costs:
	1st April 2020 – 31st March 2021
	£34,515.16

	1st April 2021 - 31st March 2022
	£37,698.58 

	1st April 2022 - 31st March 2023
	£36,111.17 

	1st April 2023 - 31st March 2024
	£37,698.58 

	1st April 2024 - 31st March 2025
	£36,047.09 


You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.
If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
