Freedom of Information Act 2000/Environmental Information Regulations 2004  
re: Cemetery plots in Leicester City
Your request for information has now been considered and the Council’s response to your questions is shown below.

You asked:
1. Current number of cemetery plots in Leicester City, broken down by type (eg single plots, companion plots, family plots, cremated remains, green burials, etc)
Answer:

The information requested is not recorded in a reportable format. Our records date back to 1849 across 4 cemeteries and close to 500,000 burials, many of which are recorded in hand written grave registers. It would require an officer to manually trawl through all these records and it would take an extraordinarily long time, far in excess of 18 hours to extract, retrieve and prepare it for disclosure.

Section 12 of the Act makes provision for public authorities to refuse requests for information where the cost of dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for local government is set at £450. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending more than 18 hours in determining whether the department holds the information, along with locating, retrieving and extracting the information.

The Council has duly determined that to undertake such an exercise would exceed the limit specified above.

This is therefore a Refusal Notice under section 17.1 of the Freedom of Information Act, because under the provisions of section 12.1 of the Act, the Council estimates that to comply with your request in its current form will exceed the appropriate limit.

You may wish to refine and resubmit your request so that it reduces the cost to within the 'appropriate limit'.

2. A list of potential land the council have identified as suitable for cemeteries.
This information is not held and the council is advising you as required by section 1.1 of the Act. We have not identified any potential land as suitable for cemeteries (although we are exploring this).  

3. How many cemetery plots this potential land could provide, broken down by address.
N/A

You may re-use the information under an Open Government Licence.

If you are dissatisfied with the handling of your request, please write, explaining your grounds of appeal, to: 

Internal Review

Information Governance & Risk
Email: info.requests@leicester.gov.uk
